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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, July 18, 2025 3:57 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Jasmine Tan; Claims; Admin A
Subject: RE: [REQUEST FOR LOD] - YOUR REF: AAD2408-011  [SHD910H] // DOA: 01/08/2024 // 

LKK REF: CD/CTI24080126/Kpa3(SKK9237L)
Attachments: AAD2408-011 - LOD.pdf

Without prejudice 
  
Dear Hsiao Tong 
  
Enclosed is our LOD for your perusal and action. 
  
Please advise your offering soon so that we can expedite and process the claims. 
 
 
 
Thank You 
Best Regards, 
Ng Wai Yin 
Finance Department 
TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 
 
* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the conduct 
of this maƩer to our solicitors without further reference to you. 
 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 
Singapore 569111 
Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 4, 2025 4:39 PM 
To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 
Cc: Jasmine Tan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [REQUEST FOR LOD] - YOUR REF: SHD910H // DOA: 01/08/2024 // LKK REF: 
CD/CTI24080126/Kpa3(SKK9237L) 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Wai Yin, 
 
Recommended repair cost: L/SUM $2,600.00 
Recommended repair days: 2days 
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