Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: jouis seow <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 21 August 2024 3:40 PM
To: ENG_Cui_Fen@spf.gov.sg

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SGR 88U-DOA: 2/8/2024

Dear Sir/ Madam

Please reply the below mention

Best Regards,

Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Tel : (65) 62898126

Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: jouis seow <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, August 19, 2024 4:13 AM

To: ENG_Cui_Fen@spf.gov.sg <ENG_Cui_Fen@spf.gov.sg>
Subject: Re: SGR 88U-DOA: 2/8/2024

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir

SGR88U repair job completed , we submit our claim as follow :

Repair cost S$ 2616.00
Rental S$ 360.00 (3days @$120.00 per day)

Total S$ 2976.00

Please let us have your offer to settle .



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel :(65)62898126
Fax :(65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, August 16, 2024 7:22 AM

To: jouis@jinauto.com.sg <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>
Subject: SGR 88U-DOA: 2/8/2024

Dear Jouis,

Email: ENG Cui Fen@spf.gov.sg

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



