Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: fiona@layauto.com

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2024 5:06 PM
To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SNP 6931 DOA : 31/07/24

Hi Rasul ,

Yes , offer accept

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2024 2:14 PM

To: fiona@layauto.com

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: SNP 6931 DOA : 31/07/24

Hi Fiona,

As per our message,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $1,700.00 /- with 03 days of repair before GST, subject to
their approval.

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth: Frint only wher necessary-



