Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, August 5, 2024 3:45 PM

To: assignments; SUR; admin-d

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Rick Teo; Janice Koh; Frauleine Khoo

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10030829 / JK || Ol- SJK3383Z (White) TP-SKM8999S || Est:
$0.00 || Colour Vide Pte Ltd

Attachments: C10030829 SKM8999S.zip

Hi Team,

We would like to request TP survey for SKM8999S. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.

Workshop information:
Address:

Tan Jasper
Direcror

Calour Vibe Pte, Lid

‘rﬂ

\ 4

Please confirm assignment.

Thank you.
Warmest Regards,

Lan Boon Chin
Executive, Claims Administration

T +65 6989 3695
E boonchin.lan@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance.

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or
privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this
communication to others and notify the senderimmediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: business@colourvibe.sg <business@colourvibe.sg>

Sent: Monday, August 5, 2024 2:23 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRI Request on 05.08.2024 || C10030829 / JK | | RE: Accident before underpass (Queensway) towards
Farrer Road on 29/07/2024 involving SKM8999S and SJK3383Z

Dear Boon Chin,

We would like to engage LKK for the PRS.

Thank you

Regards,

Tan Jasper
Director

Colour Vibe Pte. Ltd.

caolounyvibe

176 Sin Ming Dr, #05-16 Sin Ming AutoCare, Singapore 575721
Mobile: +(65) 98388249

Email : business@colourvibe.sg

From: business@colourvibe.sg <business@colourvibe.sg>

Sent: Monday, August 5, 2024 10:23 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Accident before underpass (Queensway) towards Farrer Road on 29/07/2024 involving SKM8999S and
SJIK3383Z

Dear Sir/Mdm

| would like to notify you on an insurance claim against SIK3383Z insured by your company regarding an accident
before underpass (Queensway) towards Farrer Road on 29/07/2024.

Vehicle SKM8999S will be in our workshop on 12/8/2024.
Please arrange a surveyor for PRS in the morning if possible.

Thank You

Regards,



Tan Jasper
Director

Colour Vibe Pte. Ltd.

calounyvibe.

176 Sin Ming Dr, #05-16 Sin Ming AutoCare, Singapore 575721
Mobile: +(65) 98388249

Email : business@colourvibe.sg




