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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2024 9:06 AM
To: Admin A; CS A Team
Subject: FW: REF: 24/24/24/VC05/029633- Arrange for Survey - Our Client SLT3883B & 

Lonpac Insured GBG2231B - DOA: 02/08/2024

FYI 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Hueh Yin | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, August 12, 2024 4:59 PM 
To: zila <zila@ahlimmotor.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: REF: 24/24/24/VC05/029633- Arrange for Survey - Our Client SLT3883B & Lonpac Insured GBG2231B - 
DOA: 02/08/2024 
 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
Hi Zila, 
 
Liability for this case is 50:50. 
 
Thanks. 
Huey Ni 
 
 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: zila <zila@ahlimmotor.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, August 6, 2024 2:02 PM 
To: CHARMAINE KONG <charmainekong@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Re: REF: 24/24/24/VC05/029633- Arrange for Survey - Our Client SLT3883B & Lonpac Insured GBG2231B - 
DOA: 02/08/2024  
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Hi Huey Ni, 
 
Kindly advise if your insured has file the report. 
Pls advise liability for this case. 
 
Thanks. 

Regards 
Zila 
Ah Lim Motor (AMK) 
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk 2A 
#01-09 AMK AUTOPOINT 
S568047 
TEL: 64831244 Fax: 64836170 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

On 06/08/2024 1:50 pm, CHARMAINE KONG wrote: 

Lonpac External - General 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
REF: 24/24/24/VC05/029633  
OIC: Huey Ni 
  
Dear Zila, 
  
We are appointing LKK for the survey. 
  
Aside to LKK (Rajes), FYNA please. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
Charmaine Kong 
Claims Officer  | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.268 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
  

 
  
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, 
fraud or corrupt practices. 
  
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, 
fraud or corrupt practices. 
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From: zila <zila@ahlimmotor.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, August 6, 2024 1:29 PM 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg; CHARMAINE KONG <charmainekong@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Arrange for Survey - Our Client SLT3883B & Lonpac Insured GBG2231B - DOA: 02/08/2024  
  

Hi Claims Dept,  
 
Kindly arrange for the vehicle to be survey.  
Note: Car not in - to be arrange.  

Kindly advise OIC & liability for this case. 
 
Thanks.  
--  
Regards 
Zila 
Ah Lim Motor (AMK) 
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk 2A 
#01-09 AMK AUTOPOINT 
S568047 
TEL: 64831244 Fax: 64836170 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, 
fraud or corrupt practices. 

 


