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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Elaine Lee Geok Ting <elainelee@vinsautogroup.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2024 9:58 AM
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Vin's Claims
Subject: SNN6919X - FIRST CAP TP - DOA: 25/7/2024 - YR REF: SHB1616L - FINALIZATION

Dear Kenneth, 
 
Please proceed with your figure $2270.98 for COR. 
 
Thanks and best regards, 
Elaine Lee 
Claims Consultant 
Vin's Automotive Group 
Omotenashi | Kaizen 

                                                                                                                                                                              

 

HP: +65 8682 8606 
O: +65 6453 2121 Ext: 2206 
F: +65 6459 0433 
E: elainelee@vinsautogroup.com.sg 
W: https://vinsautogroup.com.sg/ 

 
                                                                                                                                                                              

 

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, 7 August 2024 08:18 
To: Yee Shu Yaw <shuyawyee@vinsautogroup.com.sg> 
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Finalise for SNN 6919X  
  
Attach finalise for SNN 6919X, please check and confirm. Final amount subject to insurance approval 
thanks. 


