Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Crystal Lee <crystal_lee@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Friday, August 2, 2024 2:59 PM

To: assignments; admin-d

Subject: Survey Request - Manual Assigned
Attachments: 2423_001.pdf

Importance: High

<Confidential>

PRS- SHD3669K with your insured EE3238B DOA 01.08.2024
Carin

Manual Assigned

Dear Jes,
Follow-up with our conversation, kindly arrange survey accordingly.
We'll assign via Merimen once my colleagues registered the claim.

Please contact us ASAP if you cannot attend.

Thank you & Best regards,

Crystal Lee

Admin Officer, Claims Services (In-House Survey)
D: +65 6012 1316 | crystal lee@sg.msig-asia.com
Please note my direct line has changed.

‘MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 4 Shenton Way, #21-01 SGX Centre 2, Singapore 068807 | T: +65 6827 7888 |

Co. Reg. No.200412212G | msig.com.sg

AMemberof JIYRYTAME INSURANCE GROUP

5% Join our mission in protecting our planet, please consider the environment before you print.

From: Motor Survey

Sent: Friday, August 2, 2024 2:54 PM

To: 'Loke Wei Yieng' <LokeWY@sparkcarcare.com>

Cc: Jumani Bin Masudin <jumanibm@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRS- SHD3669K with your insured EE3238B DOA 01.08.2024

Dear Ms Loke,

Follow-up with our conversation confirmed car in.



Please be inform survey will conduct today by our external adjuster.

Thank you & Best regards,

Crystal Lee

Admin Officer, Claims Services (In-House Survey)
D: +65 6012 1316 | crystal lee@sg.msig-asia.com
Please note my direct line has changed.

‘MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 4 Shenton Way, #21-01 SGX Centre 2, Singapore 068807 | T: +65 6827 7888 |

Co. Reg. N0.200412212G | msig.com.sg 0 @ {D

AMemberof BVINY:MN INSURANCE GROUP

5% Join our mission in protecting our planet, please consider the environment before you print.

From: Loke Wei Yieng <LokeWY@sparkcarcare.com>

Sent: Friday, August 2, 2024 1:56 PM

To: Motor Survey <motorsurvey@sg.msig-asia.com>

Cc: Jumani Bin Masudin <jumanibm@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: PRS- SHD3669K with your insured EE3238B DOA 01.08.2024

EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any
attachment(s).

Dear Sirs/ Madams,

Herewith our vehicle repair estimate, vehicle in- workshop for PRS.

Best regards,

Loke YY (Ms)

Loyang Accident Repair
ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
DID: 62148355

eed to print? GO
' less! =i

From: canon@comfortdelgro.com.sg <canon@comfortdelgro.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 2 August 2024 1:38 pm

To: Loke Wei Yieng <LokeWY@sparkcarcare.com>

Subject: Scan Image




This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify
us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents
therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation
Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein
shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a
written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you
to print this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any
person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.



