Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 3 January 2025 7:58 AM

To: Jenny Lim

Cc: SUR

Subject: Re: Finalisation-SLT 7967S / Mercedes Benz E220D

We will advise principle the repair cost of $5699.93 B4 excess, subject to their approval thanks.

From: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@Ilaihuat.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 November 2024 5:35 pm

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Finalisation-SLT 7967S / Mercedes Benz E220D

Dear Sir
For your confirmation, please:

e Parts: $4,416.00

o %:-

e SN:$145.00

e Sundry: $100.00

e L&M:$1,038.93

e Sub-Total: $5,699.93

o Less XC: -
e Total: $5,699.93
No. of days: -

Supporting documents and photographs are enclosed for your reference.
We look forward to hearing from you soon.

Thank you.

Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

Lai Huat (Meng Kee) Motor Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722



