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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Kamarul Arriffin Bin Wahid <kamarul.a@woodlandstransport.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 26 August 2024 10:45 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: Thomas Kong; Mustapa Bin Awang; Goo Lee Ping; Kenji Lee

Subject: Re: PC1973E after repair

Hi Sir,  

 

Workshop accepts COR of $2,414.40 with LOU 04 days.  

 

Thank you.  

 
Best Regards,  

  

Kamarul Wahid  

WT Engineering 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, August 26, 2024 10:35 AM 

To: Kamarul Arriffin Bin Wahid <kamarul.a@woodlandstransport.com.sg> 

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: PC1973E after repair  

  
CAUTION: Please do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the 
content is safe.  
Hi Kamarul, 

 

As per our message, 

 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $2,414.40 /- with 04 days of repair before GST, subject to 

their approval.  

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Kamarul Arriffin Bin Wahid <kamarul.a@woodlandstransport.com.sg> 

Sent: Monday, 26 August 2024 10:10 am 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Mustapa Bin Awang <mustapa@woodlandstransport.com.sg>; Thomas Kong 

<thomas@woodlandstransport.com.sg>; Kenji Lee <kenjilee@woodlandstransport.com.sg>; Goo Lee Ping 

<goo@woodlandstransport.com.sg> 

Subject: PC1973E after repair  

  

Hi Sir,  
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Attached are the after-repair photos for your reference.  

 

Please provide COR and LOU for us to send LOD.  

 

Thank you.  

 
Best Regards,  

  

Kamarul Wahid  

WT Engineering 


