Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: lvie <claims@mcrautoworks.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 25, 2025 10:23 AM
To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: RE: SMF 2333R-DOA: 07/06/2024

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Huey Yon,

Thank you for your email.

We accept the finalized amount of LS $7350/4 DAYS of repair for vehicle number: SMF 2333 R.

We will follow up with the LOD shortly.

The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages arising therefrom
are excluded from the ambit and application of this document.

Regards,
Ivie
Motor Claims Department

MCR Motors PTE. LTD.

————— Original message -----

Date: Mar 20, 2025, 8:49:13 AM

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SMF 2333R-DOA: 07/06/2024

Dear Ivie,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $7,350 /- with 4 days of repair, subject to their approval.



Best Regards,
Huey Yon | case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Ivie <claims@mcrautoworks.com>

Sent: Thursday, 13 March 2025 9:11 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SMF 2333R-DOA: 07/06/2024

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Huey Yon,
Thank you for your email.
Please kindly send us a copy of the Adjusted Marked Estimate with adjusted parts price,

to help us facilitate the finalization of Vehicle Number: SMF 2333R
Your help is highly appreciated.

The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages
arising therefrom are excluded from the ambit and application of this document.

Regards,

Ivie
Motor Claims Department

MCR MOTORS PTE. LTD.



