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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>
Sent: Monday, 2 September 2024 8:06 AM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
Cc: Joseph Low; Foo Song Jun; Jonathan Ng; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Mohamed Nashik; 

Loong Ghien Yee; Ee Ying Yi (Michelle)
Subject: RE: Finalise - TP Claim –SNF5236G TESLA MODEL 3 RWD DOA:30/07/2024

Dear Steve, 
 
We confirm finalise lump sum amount at $4,600 & 4 working days. 
 
Thank you. 
 
--- 
Best Regards, 
Ling Ting An (Mr.) 
Motor Claims Assistant Manager 
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011  | M: +65 9819 9881 
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From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Saturday, August 31, 2024 1:50 PM 
To: Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg> 
Cc: Joseph Low <joseph@ow.sg>; Foo Song Jun <songjun.foo@ow.sg>; Jonathan Ng <jonathan.ng@ow.sg>; Shiau Chan 
(LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Mohamed Nashik <mohamed.nashik@ow.sg>; Loong Ghien Yee 
<ghienyee.loong@ow.sg>; Ee Ying Yi (Michelle) <yingyi.ee@ow.sg> 
Subject: Finalise - TP Claim –SNF5236G TESLA MODEL 3 RWD DOA:30/07/2024 
 
Hi Ting Ann, 
 
Kindly refer our finalize $4600.00 (L/S, before GST). 4 days. (Subject to insurance approval) 
 
Please confirm. 
 
 
 
 

Thanks and regards, 
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Steve Chen 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: stevechen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 

From: Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>  
Sent: Saturday, August 31, 2024 12:54 PM 
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Joseph Low <joseph@ow.sg>; Foo Song Jun <songjun.foo@ow.sg>; Jonathan Ng <jonathan.ng@ow.sg>; Mohamed 
Nashik <mohamed.nashik@ow.sg>; Loong Ghien Yee <ghienyee.loong@ow.sg>; Ee Ying Yi (Michelle) 
<yingyi.ee@ow.sg> 
Subject: Finalise - TP Claim –SNF5236G TESLA MODEL 3 RWD DOA:30/07/2024 
 
Dear Steve, 
  
Finalise - TP Claim –SNF5236G TESLA MODEL 3 RWD DOA:30/07/2024 
  
Enclosed After paint photos for your perusal. 
Our calculation as per below: 
Parts             :$4,609.18 
Nett              :$120 
Labour          :$1,410 
Lump Sum    :$6,139.18 less 20% - $4,911.35 => $4,900 
 
Kindly check & revert back to me . 
 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
--- 
Best Regards, 
Ling Ting An (Mr.) 
Motor Claims Assistant Manager 
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011  | M: +65 9819 9881 
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