Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Hi Michelle,

Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Tuesday, 6 August 2024 8:30 AM
Mirai Auto

Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

RE: SNC4483G Estimate

SNC 4483G - Finalize.pdf

Kindly refer our finalize $1300.00 (L/S, before GST). 3 days. (Subject to insurance approval)

Thanks and regards,
Steve Chen

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: stevechen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mirai Auto <claims@miraisg.com>
Sent: Wednesday, July 31, 2024 9:05 AM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: SNC4483G Estimate

Dear Steve

Enclosed SNC4483G estimate for your kind perusal.

Thank you and regards

Michelle



