Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2024 7:09 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: FINALISE - SFH4866D

From: JL Perfect Autowork <jlperfectautowork@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2024 7:07:45 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: FINALISE - SFH4866D

Dear all,
Please close.

CORLS $1500, 3 days

Thank You.

Regards,

Joanne

Mobile: 8297 9787

JL Perfect Autowork Pte. Ltd.
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #08-09
Premier @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415875

On Wed, Jul 31, 2024 at 5:43 PM Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,



Please refer attached, COR LS $1500, 3 days.

Subject to insurance approval.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: JL Perfect Autowork <jlperfectautowork@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 18, 2024 6:57 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FINALISE - SFH4866D

Dear taufikh,

Please see attached for finalisation.

Please close the case at $ 1700.00 , 3 days.

Thank You.

Regards,
Joanne

Mobile: 8297 9787



JL Perfect Autowork Pte. Ltd.
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #08-09
Premier @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415875



