Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 27 September 2024 2:08 PM

To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Harminder Kaur

Subject: FW: YOUR REF: D24006594MFCT (SHD6721Y) OUR REF:
BMS2024/09/LK0194/DS(RY) (SCV8331R) DOA: 26.07.2024

Attachments: Letter of Demand.pdf

Dear All,

Pls ignore the previous email.

As there is medical bill in the LOD, we will take over this claim instead.
Pls submit Survey report asap.

Thank you.

Chris Lim
Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
16 Raffles Quay

#42-01 Hong Leong Building
Singapore 048581

D: 6359 1813 | M: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg
A Member of NSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice:

This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If
you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the
sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris)

Sent: Friday, September 27, 2024 1:58 PM

To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: FW: YOUR REF: D24006594MFCT (SHD6721Y) OUR REF: BMS2024/09/LK0194/DS(RY) (SCV8331R) DOA:
26.07.2024

DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Dear Daphne,

LOD from TP - FYNA



Pls seek mandate by 04 Oct 2024.
Thank you.

Chris Lim
Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
16 Raffles Quay

#42-01 Hong Leong Building
Singapore 048581

D: 6359 1813 | M: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541

Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg
A Membes "*m INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice:

This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If
you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the
sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: claimstatusenquiry <claimstatusenquiry@borneomotors.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, September 27, 2024 12:03 PM

To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@mesfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Linette Cheong <linette.cheong@inchcape.com.sg>

Subject: YOUR REF: D24006594MFCT (SHD6721Y) OUR REF: BMS2024/09/LK0194/DS(RY) (SCV8331R) DOA:
26.07.2024

Hi Sir/Madam,

We refer to the attach reference.

Please find attached a copy of our letter of demand for your kind perusal.
We would appreciate if you could revert us with your offer soonest.
Thank you and awaiting for your favorable reply.

Best Regards,

Angela Tan

TPR Team, Claims Dept

Borneo Motors Pte Ltd | Inchcape Centre, 2 Pandan Crescent Level 4 | Singapore 128462
www.inchcape.com

@) Inchcape

inchcape.




