Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, November 29, 2024 11:05 AM

To: Claims; assignments

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Rick Teo; Caleen Yit

Subject: RE: TPPD Survey : Claim Ref: C1003072/CY || OI-SLL7649C (White) TP-SLA4800)J ||

Ests: $0.00 || Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd

Dear Michael,

As spoken to the repairer, third party and insured settled mutually.
No survey was done for this vehicle.

We will close this file at our end.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, July 25, 2024 9:21 AM

To: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Derrick Quok <derrick.g@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Rick Teo
<rick.teo@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Caleen Yit <caleen.yit@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: TPPD Survey : Claim Ref: C1003072/CY || OI-SLL7649C (White) TP-SLA4800J || Ests: $0.00 | | Alan’s United
Auto Pte Ltd

Dear Team,
We would like to request TP survey for TP VEH NO SLA4800J. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.

Workshop:

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
48 108 Google reviews §

Auto body shop in Singapore
® Website | | € Directions [ save
< Share || %, Call
Address: 7 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector G, Singapore
575642

Hours: Open - Closes 6 pm ~

Phone: 9712 8338
Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.

Warmest Regards,
Michael
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From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2024 5:14 PM
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRI Request on 24.04.2024 | | C20028995/HY | | RE: ARRANGE T. P. SURVEY FOR SLA4800J CLAIMING

SLL7649C ACCIDENT ON 22-07-2024

Hi Boon Chin

We like to let LKK conduct t. p. survey thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686

From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2024 2:04 PM



To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Subject: ARRANGE T. P. SURVEY FOR SLA4800J CLAIMING SLL7649C ACCIDENT ON 22-07-2024

Dear Motor Claims Dept.

Please arrange surveyor to survey our client vehicle SLA4800J for t. p. claim your insured vehicle SLL7649C accident
on 22-07-2024 thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686



