Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Jenny Lew (CTPIS) <jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, July 25, 2024 12:12 PM

To: Elmer Alfonso; Claims Dept of CTI; SUR; assignments

Cc: Hamzah Bin Sa'ad

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MY CLIENT VEHICLE SNR8941X AND YOUR INSURED

VEHICLE SMM7351T ON 23.07.2024 - SNM24D204206/C02

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam,

We will be appointing M/s LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to conduct the pre-repair survey (PRS) on your
client's vehicle.

We seek your cooperation to arrange the vehicle readily for dismantling with repair estimates during the pre-repair
survey.

Aside to LKK,

Please arrange and survey the vehicle.

Regards,

Jenny Lew
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6172 | Tel: (65) 6389 6116 | F: (65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: & il Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: EImer Alfonso <elmer@tanchong.com>

Sent: Thursday, July 25, 2024 10:39 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Hamzah Bin Sa'ad <hamzah_saad@tanchong.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MY CLIENT VEHICLE SNR8941X AND YOUR INSURED VEHICLE SMM7351T ON
23.07.2024

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Marcus Chua Kang Seng (LKK)

Elmer M. Alfonso
Service Executive
19 Ubi Road 4



Singapore 408623
TEL: 67038691 HP: 96450084
Email: elmer@tanchong.com

From: EImer Alfonso

Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2024 10:30 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Hamzah Bin Sa'ad <hamzah saad@tanchong.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MY CLIENT VEHICLE SNR8941X AND YOUR INSURED VEHICLE SMM7351T ON
23.07.2024

Dear Claim Team,

Prior to the above, our customer wish to make TP claim against your insured, direct settlement with
claiming for LOU/vehicle rental.

Please make arrangement survey on 25.07.2024 14:30 owner waiting.
Kindly check your insured liability and revert.

Regards.

Elmer M. Alfonso

Service Executive

19 Ubi Road 4

Singapore 408623

TEL: 67038691 HP: 96450084
Email: elmer@tanchong.com




