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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Phoebe Xie <phoebe.xie@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 July 2024 3:55 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: Pauline Tham; Eddie Sim; SUR

Subject: RE: SNM24D203247  SJN14T DOA:01/06/2024

[Internal] 

 

Dear Huey Yon, 

 

Please proceed with OD authorisation, Excess $3,000 (Section 1 excess $2,500 plus Additional excess $500 for 

unnamed driver) 
 

Thank you 

Phoebe Xie 

Assistant Manager, Claims Department  

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   

 

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, July 12, 2024 2:44 PM 

To: Phoebe Xie <phoebe.xie@sg.cntaiping.com> 

Cc: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>; Eddie Sim <eddie.sim@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI 

<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SNM24D203247 SJN14T DOA:01/06/2024 

 

 

 

Dear Phoebe, 

 

Any status of authorisation ? 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, June 19, 2024 8:50 AM 

To: 'Phoebe Xie' <phoebe.xie@sg.cntaiping.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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<assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Pauline Tham' <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'Eddie Sim' <eddie.sim@sg.cntaiping.com> 

Subject: RE: SNM24D203247 SJN14T DOA:01/06/2024 

 

Dear Phoebe 

 

We enclosed herewith the amended accident report, driver’s S pass and driving licence for your reference. 

 
Thank you. 

 

Kind regards. 

 

Jenny Lim 

LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD 

160 Sin Ming Drive 

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03 

Sin Ming Autocity 

Singapore 575722 

Tel: 64538110 

Fax: 64596267 

 

From: Phoebe Xie <phoebe.xie@sg.cntaiping.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 11 June 2024 4:13 pm 

To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg 

Cc: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>; Eddie Sim <eddie.sim@sg.cntaiping.com> 

Subject: SNM24D203247 SJN14T DOA:01/06/2024 

Importance: High 

 

[Internal] 

 

Dear LKK, 

 

Please survey vehicle. Excess $3,000. 

Do not authorise repairs are potential policy breach. 

Thank you 

 

Phoebe Xie 

Assistant Manager, Claims Department  

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   

 


