Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2024 11:45 AM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: PC 5067U REPAIR LIMIT

From: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2024 11:44:38 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PC 5067U REPAIR LIMIT

Hi Shiau,

On lump sum basis.

Thank You

Regards,
Ck Loh

Century Moftors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | 6 Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145.
Tel: +65 3157 2631

Mobile: +65 9743 6363

www.inchcape.com
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inchcape.

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 31, 2024 11:39 AM

To: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PC 5067U REPAIR LIMIT

Dear CK,

The repair cost on Lump Sum or part by part basis?

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, July 31,2024 11:11 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PC 5067U REPAIR LIMIT

Hi Taufikh,

We able to repair within the repair limit

Please let us have your authorization soon.

Thank You

Regards,

Ck Loh

Claims Estimator

Century Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | 6 Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145.
Tel: +65 3157 2631

Mobile: +65 9743 6363

www.inchcape.com
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From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, July 25, 2024 4:28 PM

To: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: PC 5067U REPAIR LIMIT

Hi CK,

Please take note repair limit of this bus is $30K, please check & revert if able to repair within the repair limit, as we
need to revert to Insurance side.

Thank you.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto



