Hueh Yin (LKK Auto)

From: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, July 23, 2024 2:36 PM

To: assignments

Cc: Esther Lim; SM Admin

Subject: RE: SNJ6443Y CLAIMING AGAINST XE2913S DOA:19.07.2024 D24006316MFVT
Attachments: msa.pdf; MT00017747 is Approved; SNJ6443Y GIA.pdf; SNJ6443Y PRI.pdf

Dear Sirs,

Enclosed documents for survey.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Harminder Kaur

Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
16 Raffles Quay

#42-01 Hong Leong Building
Singapore 048581

TEL : 6359 1800 | FAX : 6223 0541 |
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg
A Member of IEEENH Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA
Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward,
disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately
by return e-mail.

From: SM Admin <smadmin@sm-automotive.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, July 23, 2024 10:01 AM
To: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@ msfirstcapital.com.sg>




Cc: Esther Lim <EstherLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Motor_Claims <Motor_Claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: Re: SNJ6443Y CLAIMING AGAINST XE2913S DOA:19.07.2024

Without Prejudice
Hi Harminder

We have yet to hear from you, please send us your surveyor list asap as today after 1048hrs will exceed 48hrs whereby the vehicle has
already been at our workshop since last Friday 19.07.2024.

We look forward to hearing from you soon, thanks.

Regards,
Sukyi Chong

SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: SM Admin <smadmin@sm-automotive.sg>

Sent: Monday, 22 July 2024 2:44 pm

To: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@ msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Esther Lim <EstherLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SNJ6443Y CLAIMING AGAINST XE2913S DOA:19.07.2024

Without Prejudice

Hi Harminder

We look forward to hearing from you soon about your surveyor list as the vehicle has already been at our workshop since last Friday
19.07.2024, thanks.



Regards,
Sukyi Chong

SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: SM Admin <smadmin@sm-automotive.sg>

Sent: Monday, 22 July 2024 9:52 am

To: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Esther Lim <EstherLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SNJ6443Y CLAIMING AGAINST XE2913S DOA:19.07.2024

Without Prejudice - gentle reminder
Hi Harminder
Enclosed completed GIA for your reference.

We look forward to hearing from you soon about your surveyor list, thanks.

Regards,
Sukyi Chong

SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
Blk C #01-43 Autobay



Singapore 417883
Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: SM Admin <smadmin@sm-automotive.sg>

Sent: Friday, 19 July 2024 3:31 pm

To: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Esther Lim <EstherLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SNJ6443Y CLAIMING AGAINST XE2913S DOA:19.07.2024

Without Prejudice
Hi Harminder
Enclosed completed GIA for your reference.

We look forward to hearing from you soon about your surveyor list, thanks.

Regards,
Sukyi Chong

SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: SM Admin <smadmin@sm-automotive.sg>

Sent: Friday, 19 July 2024 11:19 am

To: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Esther Lim <EstherLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SNJ6443Y CLAIMING AGAINST XE2913S DOA:19.07.2024

Without Prejudice

Hi Harminder



We have yet to receive the completed GIA from our client, once received will forward it to you.
As the vehicle is already at our workshop hence, we enclosed accident details and a sketch plan to you for send us your surveyor list.

We look forward to hearing from you soon, thanks.

Regards,
Sukyi Chong

SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: Harminder Kaur <Harminder@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 19 July 2024 11:04 am

To: SM Admin <smadmin@sm-automotive.sg>

Cc: Esther Lim <EstherLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: FW: SNJ6443Y CLAIMING AGAINST XE2913S DOA:19.07.2024

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that our Insured have not reported the accident to us yet.
Meanwhile, kindly furnish us a copy of your client’s GIA Report for our further action.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Harminder Kaur

Motor Claims

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
16 Raffles Quay



#42-01 Hong Leong Building
Singapore 048581

TEL : 6359 1800 | FAX : 6223 0541 |
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg
A Member of LEEEEI Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA
Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward,
disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately
by return e-mail.

From: SM Admin <smadmin@sm-automotive.sg>

Sent: Friday, July 19, 2024 10:49 AM

To: Motor_Claims <Motor_Claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: SNJ6443Y CLAIMING AGAINST XE2913S DOA:19.07.2024

Without Prejudice
Hi Motor Claim Dept

Kindly send us your surveyor list, thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong

SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276



