Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 14 June 2024 2:57 PM
To: Shashitharan; SUR

Subject: RE: SMG4632M OD CLAIM
Dear Shashi,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SMC 4362M at (Excess $500.00).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 to
arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shashitharan <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, June 12, 2024 3:35 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SMG4632M OD CLAIM

Importance: High

HI

Kindly assist to arrange for survey vehicle grounded in our premises
At 17 ubiroad 4

Thanks
shashi

From: Shashitharan <shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, June 11, 2024 9:06 AM

To: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>

Subject: RE: smh4362m OD CLAIM

Importance: High




HI

Kindly assist to arrange for survey vehicle grounded in our premises
At 17 ubiroad 4

Thanks
shashi

From: Angela Tan Hong Choo PTCBC <angela.tan@inchcape.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, June 10, 2024 12:06 PM

To: Shashitharan <shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>

Subject: RE: smh4362m e filling DONE

Thank you & Regards,

Angela Tan

TPR Team, Claims Dept

Borneo Motors Pte Ltd | Inchcape Centre, 2 Pandan Crescent Level 4 | Singapore 128462
www.inchcape.com

POWERING
BETTER

@ Inchcape .
MOBILITY inchcape

From: Linette Cheong <linette.cheong@inchcape.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, June 10, 2024 11:14 AM

To: Angela Tan Hong Choo PTCBC <angela.tan@inchcape.com.sg>
Subject: FW: smh4362m e filling

Thanks.

Linette Cheong
TPR Team, Claim Dept
Email: linette.cheong@inchcape.com.sg

From: Shashitharan <shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, June 10, 2024 11:02 AM

To: Linette Cheong <linette.cheong@inchcape.com.sg>
Subject: re:smh4362m e filling

From: Apeos 4830 <toyota@inchcape.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, June 10, 2024 10:59 AM




To: Shashitharan <shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>
Subject: Scan Data from FF-1C7D225FDA1F

Number of Images: 4
Attachment File Type: PDF

Device Name: Apeos 4830
Device Location: Ubi Level 2 BP



