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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 22 July 2024 3:07 PM
To: admin-d; SUR; assignments
Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Rick Teo; Caleen Yit
Subject: TPPD Survey : Claim Ref: C10030661/CY || OI–SMA6270M (Brown) TP-SLG5323G || 

Ests: $0.00 || Teamwork Garage
Attachments: image001.jpg; image003.jpg; image004.jpg; C10030661 SLG5323G.zip

Dear Team, 

We would like to request TP survey for TP VEH NO SLG5323G. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.  

Workshop:       

Teamwork Garage 

BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK 
UBI AVE 1 #01-24 
S(408934) 

Contact: 

Darren @ 68442475 

Please confirm assignment. 

Thank you. 
 
Warmest Regards, 
Michael 
Executive, Claims Administration 
  
T +65 6989 3704 
F +65 6725 0853  
E jinghou.chin@budgetdirect.com.sg 
  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the  
link points to the correct file and location.
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The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 
  
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget 
Direct Insurance. 
  
This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & 
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) 
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is 
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, 
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this 
email is unauthorised. 
  
 
 
 
From: Darren Ng <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  
Sent: Monday, July 22, 2024 2:38 PM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: PRI Request 22.07.2024 || C10030661/CY || RE: accident involvingSMA6270M/SLG5323G on 21/7/24  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear sir, 
 
Kindly appoint LKK 
 
Regards 
Darren 
68442475 
BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK 
UBI AVE 1 #01-24 
S(408934) 
 
 
 
From: Darren Ng <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  
Sent: Monday, July 22, 2024 12:28 PM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2407-13 YOUR REF : SMA6270M PRE-REPAIRINSPECTION FOR SLG5323G 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Michael, 
 
Please refer to attached draft report as the owner haven send us the actual copy. 
 
Regards 
Darren 
68442475 
BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK 
UBI AVE 1 #01-24 
S(408934) 
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From: Claims 
Sent: Monday, 22 July 2024 12:09 pm 
To: Darren Ng; Claims 
Subject: RE: OUR REF : 2407-13 YOUR REF : SMA6270M PRE-REPAIRINSPECTION FOR SLG5323G 
 
Dear all, 
 
Please send us a copy of your client’s GIA report as our insured has yet to report the accident. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Michael 
Executive, Claims Administration 
  
T +65 6989 3704 
F +65 6725 0853  
E jinghou.chin@budgetdirect.com.sg 
  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the  
link points to the correct file and location.
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From: Darren Ng <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  
Sent: Monday, July 22, 2024 11:10 AM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: OUR REF : 2407-13 YOUR REF : SMA6270M PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SLG5323G 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
OUR REF : 2407-13 
YOUR REF : SMA6270M 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION FOR SLG5323G 
 
We are instructed by our client to noƟfy you of a road traffic accident on 21/07/24 at about 1252hrs involving our 
client’s/customer’s vehicle registraƟon number [SLG5323G] and vehicle registraƟon number [SMA6270M] driven by 
you at the material Ɵme. A copy of the Singapore accident statement /traffic police report filed is enclosed.  
 
As a result of the accident, our client’s /customer’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client/we proceed to 
repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this noƟce whether you or 
your insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle and please let us have your list of surveyors. If 
we do not receive any reply from you within the sƟpulated Ɵmeline, our client/we shall proceed to repair the vehicle 
without further reference to you. 
 
 
Regards 
Darren 
68442475 
BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK 
UBI AVE 1 #01-24 
S(408934) 
 
 
 


