Yan (LKK Auto)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, November 18, 2024 5:34 PM

To: Yan (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/029570 Accident involving GBJ5708H(OIl) & SLE6228C on 18/07/2024

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

Dear Yan,

You have our mandate to settle as follow.

Cost of repair $5,232.00

Loss of rental $327.00 - $436.00

Liability @ 50% $2,779.50 - 2,834.00

GIA fee $2.18

Total $2,781.68 - 2,836.18
Thank you.

Best Regards

Eric Woo

Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all MW" |onpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 October 2024 11:58 am

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO®@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/\VC05/029570 3pty claim against your insured
GBJ5708H(SLE6228C) *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24070321/Uua3




Lonpac External - General

Your ref: 24/24/24/VC05/029570
Our ref : CD/LPC24070321/Vua3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 5708H(LONPAC) AND SLE 6228C(TP) ON 18/07/2024

We refer to the above matter.

Itis an accident under BOLA 24a, Ol reversed and collided with TP vehicle moving out from carpark lot. We are of the
view that both parties should exercise caution.

We seek your approval to offer repairer “FALCON-AIR AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD” at 2,890.68(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed | Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair $10,940.30 S 5,232.00 (S 4,800.00 + 9%GST)
2. Loss of Rental (5days x $100.00)+9%GST | S  545.00 S 545.00 (5days x $100.00)+9%GST
Sub Total | $ 11,485.30 $ 5,777.00
@50 liability, @ BOLA 24a $ 5,742.65 S 2,888.50
3. LTA/ GIA SEARCH FEE S 2.18 S 2.18
Total | $ 5,744.83 $ 2,890.68

Surveyor recommended 3days for repair.

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

Kindly note that this inspection report dated 03/09/2024 is only for mandate purpose.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.



Best Regards,
Yan
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Email: yan@lkkauto.com| DID: 6841-6051 | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, August 19, 2024 4:37 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan®@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Yan (LKK Auto)
<yan@l|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/029570 3pty claim against your insured GBJ5708H(SLE6228C) ***
LKK REF: CD/LPC24070321/Uua3

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

Dear Mei Kwan,

Please refer to attached Ol GIA report as per request.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Eric Woo

Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all CHew lonpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.



From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT

Sent: Wednesday, August 14, 2024 4:17 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Yan (LKK Auto)
<yan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/029570 3pty claim against your insured GBJ5708H(SLE6228C) ***
LKK REF: CD/LPC24070321/Uua3

Dear Mei Kwan,

Ourinsured driver have yet to report accident till date.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Eric Woo

Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all MW" |onpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 13, 2024 4:46 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Yan (LKK Auto)
<yan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/029570 3pty claim against your insured GBJ5708H(SLE6228C) ***
LKK REF: CD/LPC24070321/Uua3

Lonpac External - General

Hi Eric,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, August 2, 2024 4:53 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Yan (LKK Auto)
<yan@l|kkauto.com>

Subject: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/029570 3pty claim against your insured GBJ5708H(SLE6228C) *** LKK
REF: CD/LPC24070321/Uua3

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

Dear Mei Kwan,

Ourinsured have yet to report accident.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Eric Woo

Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all CHew lonpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, August 2, 2024 3:55 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Yan (LKK Auto)
<yan@l|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 3pty claim against your insured GBJ5708H(SLE6228C) *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24070321/Uua3

Lonpac External - General



Dear Sir/ Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, July 22, 2024 10:29 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim®@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 3pty claim against your insured GBJ5708H(SLE6228C)

Dear Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, July 22, 2024 10:07 AM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt _claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: FW: 3pty claim against your insured GBJ5708H(SLE6228C)

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General



Our Ref : TBA
Dear Rajes,

FYNA. Insured yet to report.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or
corrupt practices.

From: joel@falconair.com.sg <joel@falconair.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, July 22, 2024 9:19 AM

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: 3pty claim against your insured GBJ5708H(SLE6228C)

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Pls see attached report and assign a surveyor.

Thanks and regards,

Joel Ng

Falcon-Air Auto Services Pte Ltd (Tampines)
Tel:67897997

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or
corrupt practices.



