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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 14 August 2024 2:15 PM
To: miCK
Cc: aa24wo@gmail.com; Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNQ 686R AND SLS 6215R ON 19/07/2024 12:08 

ALONG/AT PASIR RIS DRIVE 3 TOWARDS PASIR RIS BUS INTERCHANGE TO TPE

Dear Apple, 
 
Thank you for your reply 
 
We have checked our records and we are unable to trace your reporting of the accident to our office. For 
the purpose of assessing the claim lodged by the third party, we would require a report of the accident 
together with the original/coloured photocopied photographs showing the damages to your vehicle (if 
any) from you or your driver at the material time of the accident.  This report is in a pre-set electronic form 
and has to be lodged through any of AIG Workshops. Please refer to the back/folder accompanying your 
Certificate of Insurance for the list of our AIG Workshops conveniently located throughout Singapore. 
Please report the accident within the next 07 days, i.e by 20th August 2023. 
 
Under the Motor Claims Framework (MCF), you are required to report any accident with the accident 
vehicle (whether damaged or not) within 24 hours or by the next working day after the accident. The 
primary purpose of this reporting is to provide your version of the accident to AIG for further review/ 
investigation. 
 
We would appreciate it if you could urgently file a report at AIG approved reporting centre. 
 
 
Thank you 
 

Best Regards, 

Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler 

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphneLee@lkkauto.com|  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: miCK <yes230jm@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, August 14, 2024 1:44 PM 
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: aa24wo@gmail.com; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNQ 686R AND SLS 6215R ON 19/07/2024 12:08 ALONG/AT PASIR RIS DRIVE 3 
TOWARDS PASIR RIS BUS INTERCHANGE TO TPE 
 
Dear Daphne,  
 
Thank you for your attached email dated 13 August 2024. 
 
This serve to inform that we have decided to let our Insurer take over this case. 
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Kindly contact our Insurer accordingly. 
 
Once again, Thank you for your patience and understanding. 
 
Regards 
 
Apple 
Sent from my iPhone 
 

From: "Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)" <daphnelee@lkkauto.com> 
Date: 13 August 2024 at 4:43:09 PM SGT 
To: Ms Hello <aa24wo@gmail.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNQ 686R AND SLS 6215R ON 
19/07/2024 12:08 ALONG/AT PASIR RIS DRIVE 3 TOWARDS PASIR RIS 
BUS INTERCHANGE TO TPE 

Dear Apple, 

 Attached the video footage and photos of vehicle damages for your reference. 

 We are checking total repair amount from the third-party workshop. 

 We will follow up and get back you soon. 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler 

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphneLee@lkkauto.com|  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Ms Hello <aa24wo@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, August 13, 2024 11:09 AM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNQ 686R AND SLS 6215R ON 19/07/2024 12:08 
ALONG/AT PASIR RIS DRIVE 3 TOWARDS PASIR RIS BUS INTERCHANGE TO TPE 

  

Hi,  
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Any update for the photo? 

  

  

Regards  

Apple Wong 

 

On 5 Aug 2024, at 7:29 PM, Ms Hello 
<aa24wo@gmail.com> wrote: 

  

您好， 

  

我不记得是在什么时候撞上，我刚检查了车子没

有碰撞的痕迹，我在检查看摄像机，也没有记录

。 

  

请问是在什么状况下发生这场车祸？ 

您方便给我照片还是视频吗？ 

我需要想回去去是什么时候发生的事故。 

我看您画的纸，是驾车方向。 

那个地方是撞伤部位？ 

谢谢您 

  

Regards  

Ms.Wong 
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On 5 Aug 2024, at 4:13 PM, Mei Kwan 
(LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

  

Our Ref: CD/AIG24070320/Uma3 

AIG Ref: 9122641018SG 

  

WONG CHEW PEI 

26 THONG SOON AVENUE 

SINGAPORE 787466 

  

Dear Sirs, 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNQ 686R AND SLS 
6215R ON 19/07/2024 12:08 ALONG/AT 
PASIR RIS DRIVE 3 TOWARDS PASIR RIS 
BUS INTERCHANGE TO TPE 

We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd has been 
appointed to act on the behalf of your 
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 
(AIG) to settle a THIRD-PARTY claim against 
you for an accident which happened on the 
above-mentioned date and location. 

Kindly proceed to lodge your GIA report 
within five (05) working days of receipt of this 
letter, giving the version of the accident 
amongst other things related to the accident. 
The GIA report can be lodged at any of AIG 
reporting centres. You may refer to your 
Certificate of Insurance for the list of the 
reporting centres. 

  

If you have any information to add or any 
amendments to make, please contact the 
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undersigned within five days from the date of 
this letter. 

  

Please note that the standing of your 
insurance policy such as NCD, premium & 
etc would be affected. 

Yours faithfully, 

  

 

Daphne Lee 

Claims 

Tel : 6841 2157 

Email : DaphneLee@lkkauto.com 

  

c.c.       Claims Manager 

               AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 

               (Motor Claims Dept) 
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
22 Jul
2024
11:11

Clm Dtl Modified Claimant's Name: -> NG CHUAN MING. Claimant's ID: -> SXXXX557C. [A] HOW MEI KWAN

2
22 Jul
2024
11:11

Clm Veh Model
Changed (207193) VOLKSWAGEN POLO GP 1.2 TSI 6C13EZ SR LED (A). [A] HOW MEI KWAN

3
22 Jul
2024
11:11

Clm Created
Reg No: SLS6215R. Acct Date: 2024/07/19. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific I
nsurance Pte. Ltd. (SG). TP Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). Works
hop: Hup Motor Trading & Service (HQ)

[A] HOW MEI KWAN

4
22 Jul
2024
11:11

Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI KWAN

5
22 Jul
2024
11:11

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2024/07/31 [A] HOW MEI KWAN

6
22 Jul
2024
11:11

Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI KWAN

7
22 Jul
2024
11:11

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insura
nce Pte. Ltd. (Express)

[A] Merimen
Administrator

8
22 Jul
2024
11:11

Label Added (20224):Field Survey. [A] Merimen
Administrator

9
22 Jul
2024
11:11

Label Added (19):Fastlane. [A] HOW MEI KWAN

10
22 Jul
2024
11:11

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> MARCUS CHUA [A] HOW MEI KWAN

11
31 Jul
2024
10:22

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] Daphne Lee Mooi

Ngiuk

12
05 Aug
2024
14:44

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW HSIAO

TONG

13
07 Aug
2024
07:49

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] MARCUS CHUA

14
08 Aug
2024
09:21

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] HOW MEI KWAN

15
12 Aug
2024
14:24

Clm Registration
Modified Acct Time:12:00:00->12:05:00. [I] AIG OneClaim

Integration User

16
07 Oct
2024
16:16

Adj Rpt Initiated [A] JOANNE LEE
KHANG MIN

17
07 Oct
2024
16:16

Ins Email
Updated [None] -> [EMAIL@GMAIL.COM] [A] JOANNE LEE

KHANG MIN

18
07 Oct
2024
16:16

Clm Dtl Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3. [A] JOANNE LEE
KHANG MIN

19
07 Oct
2024
16:16

Clm Dtl Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2017/09/28. [A] JOANNE LEE
KHANG MIN

20
07 Oct
2024
16:16

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE LEE
KHANG MIN

21
10 Oct
2024
10:53

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:842.53:Liability: 100% (BOLA 27) *Quantum: $842.53(all-in). Please refer to
adjuster report for details. *For your approval please.

[A] Daphne Lee Mooi
Ngiuk

22
07 Nov
2024
14:19

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Marhoum, Firman

23
11 Nov
2024
12:58

Adj Next Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2024/07/31. Mandate Remarks: please proceed with settl
ement @ $842.53 [COR- $613.10 LOR-$200 LTA/GIA-$29.43] ** subject to final repair
bill & ATA

[I] Syed-Yusoff,
Saliha

24
11 Nov
2024
12:58

Adj Mandate Set Approved:842.53:please proceed with settlement @ $842.53 [COR- $613.10 LOR-$200
LTA/GIA-$29.43] ** subject to final repair bill & ATA

[I] Syed-Yusoff,
Saliha

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
No record

11/11/24, 3:04 PM Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=1438580&extid=458654&CFID=55… 1/2

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=554445&CFTOKEN=413062e694f02292-F5E8A396-9658-D0B1-1D11CCE42DBE4A35&USID=12435&RID=3754505
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=554445&CFTOKEN=413062e694f02292-F5E8A396-9658-D0B1-1D11CCE42DBE4A35&USID=12435&RID=3754505
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=554445&CFTOKEN=413062e694f02292-F5E8A396-9658-D0B1-1D11CCE42DBE4A35&USID=12435&RID=3754505
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=554445&CFTOKEN=413062e694f02292-F5E8A396-9658-D0B1-1D11CCE42DBE4A35&USID=12435&RID=3754505&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1438580%26extid%3D458654%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=554445&CFTOKEN=413062e694f02292-F5E8A396-9658-D0B1-1D11CCE42DBE4A35&USID=12435&RID=3754505


Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

3204589 22 Jul 2024
11:18:00

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

SLS6215R SNQ686R 12.00

3207924 26 Jul 2024
16:43:52 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SLS6215R HOW MEI
KWAN xx.xx

3249803 07 Oct 2024
16:16:12

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SLS6215R SNQ686R 12.00

11/11/24, 3:04 PM Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=1438580&extid=458654&CFID=55… 2/2
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