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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 9 December 2024 1:39 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto); AutoInsure

Subject: RE: SGT 9921U-DOA:08/07/2024

Hi Taufikh, 

 

 

We confirm the total COR. 

 

 

Thank You 
 

Regards,  

Ck Loh 

Claims Estimator 

Century Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | 6 Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145. 

Tel: +65 3157 2631 

Mobile: +65 9743 6363 

www.inchcape.com 

 

 
 

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, December 9, 2024 1:23 PM 

To: AutoInsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg> 

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SGT 9921U-DOA:08/07/2024 

 
Hi CK, We have seek m andate from Liberty, they have approved COR $4585 , 3 days. Reg ards Taufikh Lkk Auto From : Taufik h (LKKAuto) Sent: Monday, 2 December 2024 3: 51 pm To: AutoI nsure <cl aims@ autoi nsure. com. sg> Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@ lkkauto. com> 

 

Hi CK, 

 

We have seek mandate from Liberty, they have approved COR $4585 , 3 days. 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

 

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 2 December 2024 3:51 pm 

To: AutoInsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg> 

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SGT 9921U-DOA:08/07/2024 

 

Hi Ck, 

 

My side have to seek mandate from Liberty insurance 1st before confirmation of repair cost. 
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We will update once Liberty side give approval. 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

 

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 2 December 2024 3:25 pm 

To: AutoInsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg> 

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SGT 9921U-DOA:08/07/2024 

 

Hi CK, 

 

Please refer attached, COR $4585 , 3 days. 

 

Subject to insurance approval. 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto  

 

 

From: AutoInsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 2 December 2024 3:03 pm 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: AutoInsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SGT 9921U-DOA:08/07/2024 

 

Hi Taufikh, 

 

 

Attached supplier invoice for your review. 

 

 

Thank You 
 

Regards,  

Ck Loh 

Claims Estimator 

Century Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | 6 Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145. 

Tel: +65 3157 2631 

Mobile: +65 9743 6363 

www.inchcape.com 

 

 
 

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, December 2, 2024 3:02 PM 

To: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg> 
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Cc: AutoInsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SGT 9921U-DOA:08/07/2024 

 
Hi Ck, Please forward us the invoice, will put up 10 % margin for the parts. Reg ards Taufikh Lkk Auto From: C hen Khuan L oh <C henKhuan. L oh@ autoinsure. com . sg> Sent: Monday, 2 December 2024 2: 57 pm To: Taufik h (LKKAuto) <Taufik h@ lkk auto. com> 

 

Hi Ck, 

 

Please forward us the invoice, will put up 10 % margin for the parts. 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

 

From: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 2 December 2024 2:57 pm 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: AutoInsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SGT 9921U-DOA:08/07/2024 

 

Hi Taufikh, 

 

 

Thank you for your o<er. Unfortunately, we find it unacceptable as it is below our cost. 

 

Could you kindly confirm whether, upon providing the parts invoice, we would be eligible for a 10% 

margin? If this is acceptable, we will send you the parts invoice promptly. 

 

We look forward to your response. 

 

 

Thank You 

 

Regards,  

Ck Loh 

Claims Estimator 

Century Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | 6 Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145. 

Tel: +65 3157 2631 

Mobile: +65 9743 6363 

www.inchcape.com 

 

 
 

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, December 2, 2024 2:44 PM 

To: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg> 

Cc: AutoInsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SGT 9921U-DOA:08/07/2024 

 
Hi CK, Please refer attached, COR $2769. 40 , 3 days. Subject to insurance approval. R egards Taufikh Lkk Auto From : Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhu an. Loh@ autoi nsure. com. sg> Sent: Wed nesday, 27 November 2024 2: 32 pm To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@ lkkauto. com > 

 

Hi CK, 

 

Please refer attached, COR $2769.40 , 3 days. 

 

Subject to insurance approval. 
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Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto  

 

 

From: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 27 November 2024 2:32 pm 

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: AutoInsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SGT 9921U-DOA:08/07/2024 

 

Hi Huey Yon, 

 

 

We have attached the before and after paint photos for your review. 

 

Please let us have your o<er soon. 

 

 

Thank You 

 

Regards,  

Ck Loh 

Claims Estimator 

Century Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | 6 Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145. 

Tel: +65 3157 2631 

Mobile: +65 9743 6363 

www.inchcape.com 

 

 
 

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, November 27, 2024 2:16 PM 

To: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg> 

Subject: SGT 9921U-DOA:08/07/2024 

 
Dear Sir/Mdm, Kindly advise vehicle status. If vehicle has been repaired, please fi nalize with us. Best Reg ards, Huey Yon | case handl er LKK Auto Consultants Pte. Ltd. Phone: 6256- 3561 Fax: 62564315 em ail: hueyy on@ lkkauto. com Blk 51, Paya Ubi 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

Kindly advise vehicle status. 

 

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.  

 
Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 

 


