Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2024 8:03 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: OD CLAIM: CB7426M / DOA: 04/07/2024 - FINALIZE REPAIR (LUMP SUM)

From: Lynn Yap (Ding Auto) <Claims@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2024 8:02:49 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>; Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Joyce (Ding Auto -
Carros Branch) <admin.carros@dingauto.sg>

Subject: Re: OD CLAIM: CB7426M / DOA: 04/07/2024 - FINALIZE REPAIR (LUMP SUM)

Dear Taufikh,

We are agreeable to your offer.
Please send back the EzClaim file for us to submit our finalization & final bill.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Lynn Yap
Claims Department

+65 9385 8368 +65 6993 7808
www.dingauto.sg claims@dingauto.sg
176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 Sin Ming Autocare S575721
Blk 10 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C #01-20 S575645 60 Jalan Lam Huat #06-46/47 Carros Centre S737869

On Thu, 10 Oct 2024 at 3:53 PM, Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Lynn,

Please refer attached, COR LS $13200, 8 days.



Subject to insurance approval.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Lynn Yap (Ding Auto) <Claims@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 26 September 2024 11:11 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Joyce (Ding Auto - Carros Branch) <admin.carros@dingauto.sg>; Jun
Kai (Ding Auto - Carros Branch) <carros.workshop@dingauto.sg>; Eve (Ding Auto - Carros Branch)
<consultant@dingauto.sg>

Subject: OD CLAIM: CB7426M / DOA: 04/07/2024 - FINALIZE REPAIR (LUMP SUM)

Dear Taufikh,

We have successfully finished repairing the vehicle mentioned above and are now seeking to
finalize this repair.

Please review the attached after paint photos for your examination.

Repair:  Lump Sum

Cost Mark Up Amount
Parts: $20,340.00 + 0% $20,340.00
Parts (S): $1,920.00 + 0% $1,920.00
Miscellaneous: $-
Labour & Spray Paint: $1,129.94

Total: $23,389.94
-20% L/S:  $4,677.99

Finalize Amount: $ 18,711.95




Your assistance in expediting this finalization would be greatly appreciated.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Lynn Yap
Claims Department

Mobile +65 9385 8368 Office +65 6993 7808

Web www.dingauto.sg Email claims@dingauto.sg

HQ 176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 Sin Ming Autocare S575721

Branch Blk 10 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C #01-20 S575645 NorthWest Branch 60 Jalan Lam Huat #06-46/47 Carros Centre S737869




