Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 September 2024 5:09 PM

To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Emily Tan Su Min

Subject: RE: D24006190MFCT/CTPL/ET SURVEY TP CLAIM: SMC6229Z // SHA2511D *** LKK

REF : CD/FCI24070288/Ema3

Dear Daphne,
Pls submit survey report as we had received LDO from TP.
Thank you.

Chris Lim
Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
16 Raffles Quay

#42-01 Hong Leong Building
Singapore 048581

D: 6359 1813 | M: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg
atember ot [IEToIE] INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice:

This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If
you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the
sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, August 5, 2024 3:50 PM

To: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: RE: D24006190MFCT/CTPL/ET SURVEY TP CLAIM: SMC6229Z // SHA2511D *** LKK REF :
CD/FCI24070288/Ema3

Dear Emily,
We are still pending for finalize with TP repairer.
Thank you

Best Regards,

Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphneLee@lkkauto.com |




