Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Best Regards,
Tobiah Sia | HR Dept.

Tobiah Sia (LKK Auto)

Tuesday, 13 August 2024 2:29 PM
Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

FW: Document Fee(s) Paid

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-4178 | email: tobiahsia@lkkauto.com | fax: 6742-9343

From: spf_document_purchase@spf.gov.sg <spf_document_purchase@spf.gov.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, August 13, 2024 2:28 PM
To: Tobiah Sia (LKK Auto) <tobiahsia@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Document Fee(s) Paid

Dear Applicant,

This is to confirm that the document fee for application bearing Transaction Reference Number:
TP000297428 has been paid successfully.

Receipt Number:
Transaction Date:
Payment Mode:

Collection Mode:

Amount Paid:

Report(s) Requested:

2  The document(s) will be delivered to your mailing address via registered mail.

This is a system generated message.
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