Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 August 2024 9:29 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SLP7935E - ECICS OD - DOA: 15/07/2024 - AUTHORISATION TO REPAIR
Hi

fyip

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Yee Shu Yaw <shuyawyee@vinsautogroup.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, August 5, 2024 8:53 AM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLP7935E - ECICS OD - DOA: 15/07/2024 - AUTHORISATION TO REPAIR

Good morning,
Please proceed with $3328 before GST.

Best regards,
Shu Yaw

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, August 5, 2024 8:41 AM

To: Vin's Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLP7935E - ECICS OD - DOA: 15/07/2024 - AUTHORISATION TO REPAIR

Please referto 22.07.24 email, already sent you finalise waiting for your confirmation.

From: VAuG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 2 August 2024 5:30 pm

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLP7935E - ECICS OD - DOA: 15/07/2024 - AUTHORISATION TO REPAIR

Good afternoon,



Please kindly check the attached marked estimate and supplier invoice.

Parts: $2280.00 (+10%) = $2508.00
Labour: $820.00
Total: $3328.00

Can we proceed to finalise the case @ $3328.00 before GST?

Best Regards,
Shu Yaw (EXT: 2202)
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** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! **
** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! **
** w.e.f 28th June 2022, our head office have shifted to 20 Sin Ming Lane #06-65/66 Singapore 573968 **

On Mon, 22 Jul 2024 at 08:10, Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Attach finalise for SLP 7935E, please check and confirm. Final amount subject to insurance approval
thanks.

From: VAuG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 18 July 2024 9:20 am

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: SLP7935E - ECICS OD - DOA: 15/07/2024 - AUTHORISATION TO REPAIR

Good morning,

Can we kindly have the authorization to repair this vehicle?

Best Regards,



Shu Yaw (EXT: 2202)
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Website: www.vinsautogroup.com.sg
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** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! **
** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! **
** w.e.f 28th June 2022, our head office have shifted to 20 Sin Ming Lane #06-65/66 Singapore 573968 **



