Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 7 October 2024 9:48 AM

To: Gan, Angiegeokling; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Case Assignment TP - SKN89R - 15/07/2024 - 1467624520SG ***LKK REF:
CS/AIG24070263/AVP3

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Veron,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Gan, Angiegeokling <Angiegeokling.Gan@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 7 October 2024 8:52 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Case Assignment TP - SKN89R - 15/07/2024 - 1467624520SG

Dear LKK,

We have received LOD from TP lawyer. Kindly submit your report on an urgent basis. Thank you.



Accident involving SKN 89R and SFG 211A along PIE on 15/07/2024

We are instructed by Tay Boon Kiat, the owner of SKN 89R to claim damages against your
insured driver in connection with a road traffic accident on 15.07.2024 at about 10.15 SGT
along PIE involving our client’s motor vehicle registration number SKN 89R and motor
vehicle registration number SFG 211 A owned by your insured at the material time.

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured driver's negligent driving
and/or management of your insured’s vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client’s
vehicle was damaged and our client has been put to loss and expense, particulars of which
are as follows:-

(1) cost of repairs (agreed with your surveyor LKK Auto Consultants) $13,500.00
(2) rental of alternative vehicle 3 2.000.00
(3) further loss of use for 2 days of PRI $ 300.00
(4) GIA report $ 31.00
(5) LTA search 3 2725
(6) photocopying, postages, transport and other incidentals $  200.00
(7) costs $ 2.000.00

$18,058.25

Best Regards,

Angie Gan
Claims Adjuster, Auto Claims
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AlG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10

Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1013
Angiegeokling.Gan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards.
Click here to find out more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and
any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Do-Not-Reply <do-not-reply@merimen.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 23, 2024 5:00 PM

To: Gan, Angiegeokling <Angiegeokling.Gan@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Case Assignment TP - SKN89R - 15/07/2024 - 1467624520SG

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

This mail is associated with :
*SKN89R (1467624520SG)
[SFG211A]

TP
Tay Boon Kiat

2



Jul 15 2024 12:00AM
[NG LYE YOKE]
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
Dear Gan, Angie-GL,

Please note that a claim has been assigned to you for handling in Merimen. For your action and follow up please.
This is an auto-generated email. Do not reply to this email.

Sent by : Merimen Administrator (MERIMEN TECHNOLOGIES (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this emailin error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any
virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is
the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by
American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any
loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



