Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 July 2024 2:47 PM

To: Kai Motor; assignments; Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicles Nissan Nv200 GBJ 7773 E & GBG 6148 H on 13/07/2024
at 12:30.

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Noted with thanks.

We will arrange accordingly.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2024 10:37 AM

To: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving Vehicles Nissan Nv200 GBJ 7773 E & GBG 6148 H on 13/07/2024 at 12:30.

KAI MOTOR TRADING
BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1
#01-440, SINGAPORE 408701
TEL: 67474006 | FAX: 67437591
E-mail: kaimotor@gmail.com
REG NO: 44223100L

Date: 16/07/2024

ATTN: Motor Claim Department
Your Insured Vehicle - GBG 6148 H

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD.
78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building

Singapore 079120

Too Chol Fang

Tel 6741 4263 Fax 6741 4108



Dear Sir / Mdm,

Accident Involving Vehicles Nissan Nv200 GBJ 7773 E & GBG 6148 H on 13/07/2024 at 12:30.

We are writing on behalf of KIM CHUAN GAS, SANITRAY & CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD
the registered owner of GBJ 7773 E which was involved on the above-mentioned accident
between GBG 6148 H .

Investigation reveals that the motor vehicle number GBG 6148 H was insured with you at the
material time of the said accident.

As a result of the accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence of your insured
vehicle number GBG 6148 H Therefore, our client is holding you liable for the repair costs and
other consequential loss which was sustained by him/her/them.

Kindly arrange your representative to survey our client’s vehicle at KAl MOTOR TRADING
Blk 3007, Ubi Road 1, #01-440, Singapore 408701 within two (2) days from the date hereof as
to avoid further losses incur.

We enclosed hereby the GIA report of GBG 6148 H for your kind attention.

Failing which, our client have no alternative but to proceed with the necessary repairs and
the will be forward to you for reimbursement.

Yours faithfully,

Have a nice day with thanks.

REARIFH—XK,

Ms Kim
Kai Motor Trading

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440
Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006



