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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Lim Yan Shi Jenn <jenn.lim@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 16 October 2024 12:05 PM
To: karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
Cc: Coco Lu Ting; Loi Ai Ting; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Subject: LOD - TP - SNL9561J, claim TP FCI SHD6575C, DOA: 10.07.2024
Attachments: SNL9561J_FCI.pdf

Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
Attached our repair invoice, rental bill & agreement, GIA search and Authorisation to Act for your perusal. 
  
Our client’s claim is as stated below: 
  
COR       $ 6,941.12 
LOR       $     523.20 ($130.80 X 4 days) 
GIA       $          2.18 
                --------------- 
Total      $ 7,466.50 
                ---------------- 
  
Kindly offer for settlement. 
  
Appreciate. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Jenn Lim (Ms) 
 

 
 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
TEL: 6568 4693  F: +65 6565 1240  •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, October 16, 2024 10:50 AM 
To: Lim Yan Shi Jenn <jenn.lim@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Cc: Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
<Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LOD - TP - EN636H, claim TP EQ GBG3517X, DOA: 15.12.2023 
 














