Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 22 July 2024 8:59 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: SNM24D203934/C01/CB356C/LEWLC - DOA: 09/07/2024 07:25 - Total Loss

Hi Shiau Chan,
Kindly ignore previous email. Revise calculation MV.

Purchase price $60,100.00
Depreciation per year $6,010.00
New vehicle on 23/03/2023 ($60,100.00) - Accident on 09/07/2024 = 16 month usage ($8,013.33) = $52,086.67 (MV)

Thanks and regards,
Steve Chen
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: stevechen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, July 22, 2024 8:51 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: SNM24D203934/C01/CB356C/LEWLC - DOA: 09/07/2024 07:25 - Total Loss

Hi Shiau Chan,

As discuss with Simon. Kindly revert calculation MV at below.

Purchase price $60,100.00
Depreciation per year $6,010.00
New vehicle on 23/03/2023 ($60,100.00) - Accident on 09/07/2024 = 16 month usage ($10,016.66) = $50,084.00 (MV)

Thanks and regards,
Steve Chen
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: stevechen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, July 19, 2024 4:36 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SNM24D203934/C01/CB356C/LEWLC - DOA: 09/07/2024 07:25 - Total Loss
Importance: High

Dear Steve,

Please refer to the attachment.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jenny Lew <jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, July 19, 2024 4:03 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@l|kkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SNM24D203934/C01/CB356C/LEWLC - DOA: 09/07/2024 07:25 - Total Loss
Importance: High

Hi LKK

Pls confirm the est MV amount.
Regards,

Jenny Lew
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6172 | Tel: (65) 6389 6116 | F: (65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: K il Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.



