Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Andy Chin <andy@i-deal.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2024 5:50 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID20800 & GBA9765M ONBOARD RAMP- POWERED

LIGHTER (RPL) TOWARDS TEKONG FERRY TERMINAL ON 10/07/2024

Hi Boss,

My hirer hope that he can settled with your client privately by paying up the repair costs for the
damages. Please kindly inform me what is the next step I should follow or inform my hirer to do,
thanks.

Best regards,

Andy Chin

87789969

On 2024-09-24 15:20, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID20800 & GBA9765M ONBOARD RAMP- POWERED LIGHTER (RPL) TOWARDS TEKONG
FERRY TERMINAL ON 10/07/2024

We have been appointed by MINDEF as claims adjuster to handle all traffic accident claims involving military

vehicles with effect from December 2021.

We understand that the owner/ driver of GBA9765M would like to settle the matter directly.

The summary of our claim is as follow: -

1. Cost of Repair MID20800 S 323.13
2. LTA/ Insurance Search Fee S 27.25
3. LKK Professional Fee (with GST) S 250.70

TOTAL | $ 601.08
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Please confirm if you would like to settle the matter directly with our principal. If yes, we will advise the next course
of action.

Kindly call the undersigned should your need further assistance.

Please let us have your decision within the next 10 days.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead
Third Party Direct Settlement
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Best Regards,
Andy Chin
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I-DEAL AUTO TRADING PTE LTD
18 Sin Ming Lane

#03-17 Midview City
Singapore 573960

Hp : 8778 9969



Tel: 6265 9969
Fax: 6334 9969



