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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 November 2024 10:42 AM

To: Wong Chun Wei

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: D24006009MFSH  SML4662X MZ MS FIRST TP CMagnaye Ana Margie 

Marasigan (StridesASvcs/Ins & Claims/Tx,RAC&PH) 

<Ana.Magnaye@stridespremier.com.sg>LAIM YOUR REF: SHD6313S OUR REF: 

SML4662Z

Hi Wong, 

 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $42,501.28 /- with 16+02= 18 days of repair before GST, 

subject to their approval. 

 

 

 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  
The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct  
file and location.

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 
 

From: Wong Chun Wei <chunwei.wong@eurokars.com.sg> 

Sent: Tuesday, 22 October 2024 8:12 pm 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: ESPL Claims Admin <claims.espl@eurokars.com.sg>; Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: D24006009MFSH SML4662X MZ MS FIRST TP CMagnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (StridesASvcs/Ins & 

Claims/Tx,RAC&PH) <Ana.Magnaye@stridespremier.com.sg>LAIM YOUR REF: SHD6313S OUR REF: SML4662Z  

  

Dear Rasul, 

 

Our COR computation is attached for your agreement. 

COR: $42,501.28 before excess and GST 9%. 

18 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for survey/authorization/spare parts, 

Sat/Sun/PH). 

Kindly confirm the above as soon as possible 

 
Thank you. 
  
Best regards. 
  

 
  
Wong Chun Wei  

Insurance Claim Officer | Body & Paint 



2

  
5 UBI CLOSE, Singapore 408605 
Tel. +65 6331 0680 | chunwei.wong@eurokars.com.sg 
EurokarsGroup.com  |  Eurokars Group LinkedIn 
The contents of this email and attachments herein are strictly confidential. It may contain privileged information and is intended only for the use of 
the individual or entity to whom the email is addressed.  If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by replying to 
this message and then delete it from your system. Do not read, copy, use or circulate this communication. Internet communications are not secure. 
While every reasonable effort has been made to ensure that this communication has not been tampered with Trans Eurokars Group and its 
affiliates is not responsible for alterations made to the contents of this message without its express consent. Any individual or entity who 
communicates with us is taken to have accepted these risks. In providing personal data to us, you consent to us using it for the purposes set out in 
https://www.eurokarsgroup.com/data-protection/. 
  

From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, July 12, 2024 2:28 PM 

To: Wong Chun Wei <chunwei.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Jason Wong 

<jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Yao Sheng <yaosheng.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Jun Xian 

<junxian.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; ESPL Claims Admin <claims.espl@eurokars.com.sg>; Ahmad Faisal Bin Hamid 

<faisal.hamid@eurokars.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: D24006009MFSH SML4662X MZ MS FIRST TP CMagnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (StridesASvcs/Ins & 

Claims/Tx,RAC&PH) <Ana.Magnaye@stridespremier.com.sg>LAIM YOUR REF: SHD6313S OUR REF: SML4662Z  

  
Dear Chun Wei, 
  
Kindly check liability with insurance. 
  
Thank you. 
  

  

Best Regards, 

Rajes | Admin 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: Wong Chun Wei <chunwei.wong@eurokars.com.sg> 

Sent: Friday, July 12, 2024 2:22 PM 

To: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Jason Wong 

<jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Yao Sheng <yaosheng.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Jun Xian 

<junxian.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; ESPL Claims Admin <claims.espl@eurokars.com.sg>; Ahmad Faisal Bin Hamid 

<faisal.hamid@eurokars.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: D24006009MFSH SML4662X MZ MS FIRST TP CMagnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (StridesASvcs/Ins & 

Claims/Tx,RAC&PH) <Ana.Magnaye@stridespremier.com.sg>LAIM YOUR REF: SHD6313S OUR REF: SML4662Z 

  

Dear Rajes, 

  

Any update for the liability status 

  
Thank you. 
  
Best regards. 
  

 
  
Wong Chun Wei  

Insurance Claim Officer | Body & Paint 
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5 UBI CLOSE, Singapore 408605 
Tel. +65 6331 0680 | chunwei.wong@eurokars.com.sg 
EurokarsGroup.com  |  Eurokars Group LinkedIn 
The contents of this email and attachments herein are strictly confidential. It may contain privileged information and is intended only for the use of 
the individual or entity to whom the email is addressed.  If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by replying to 
this message and then delete it from your system. Do not read, copy, use or circulate this communication. Internet communications are not secure. 
While every reasonable effort has been made to ensure that this communication has not been tampered with Trans Eurokars Group and its 
affiliates is not responsible for alterations made to the contents of this message without its express consent. Any individual or entity who 
communicates with us is taken to have accepted these risks. In providing personal data to us, you consent to us using it for the purposes set out in 
https://www.eurokarsgroup.com/data-protection/. 
  

From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, July 10, 2024 5:52 PM 

To: Wong Chun Wei <chunwei.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Jason Wong 

<jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Yao Sheng <yaosheng.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Jun Xian 

<junxian.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; ESPL Claims Admin <claims.espl@eurokars.com.sg>; Ahmad Faisal Bin Hamid 

<faisal.hamid@eurokars.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: D24006009MFSH SML4662X MZ MS FIRST TP CMagnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (StridesASvcs/Ins & 

Claims/Tx,RAC&PH) <Ana.Magnaye@stridespremier.com.sg>LAIM YOUR REF: SHD6313S OUR REF: SML4662Z 

  
Dear Chun wei, 
  
Noted with thanks. 
  
We will arrange accordingly. 
  

  
  

Best Regards, 

Rajes | Admin 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: Wong Chun Wei <chunwei.wong@eurokars.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, July 10, 2024 5:14 PM 

To: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Jason Wong 

<jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Yao Sheng <yaosheng.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Jun Xian 

<junxian.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; ESPL Claims Admin <claims.espl@eurokars.com.sg>; Ahmad Faisal Bin Hamid 

<faisal.hamid@eurokars.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: D24006009MFSH SML4662X MZ MS FIRST TP CMagnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (StridesASvcs/Ins & 

Claims/Tx,RAC&PH) <Ana.Magnaye@stridespremier.com.sg>LAIM YOUR REF: SHD6313S OUR REF: SML4662Z 

  

Dear Rajes, 

  

Car in workshop at 27A Tanjung Penjuru 

  
Thank you. 
  
Best regards. 
  

 
  
Wong Chun Wei  

Insurance Claim Officer | Body & Paint 
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5 UBI CLOSE, Singapore 408605 
Tel. +65 6331 0680 | chunwei.wong@eurokars.com.sg 
EurokarsGroup.com  |  Eurokars Group LinkedIn 
The contents of this email and attachments herein are strictly confidential. It may contain privileged information and is intended only for the use of 
the individual or entity to whom the email is addressed.  If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by replying to 
this message and then delete it from your system. Do not read, copy, use or circulate this communication. Internet communications are not secure. 
While every reasonable effort has been made to ensure that this communication has not been tampered with Trans Eurokars Group and its 
affiliates is not responsible for alterations made to the contents of this message without its express consent. Any individual or entity who 
communicates with us is taken to have accepted these risks. In providing personal data to us, you consent to us using it for the purposes set out in 
https://www.eurokarsgroup.com/data-protection/. 
  

From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, July 10, 2024 5:06 PM 

To: Wong Chun Wei <chunwei.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Jason Wong 

<jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Yao Sheng <yaosheng.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Jun Xian 

<junxian.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; ESPL Claims Admin <claims.espl@eurokars.com.sg>; Ahmad Faisal Bin Hamid 

<faisal.hamid@eurokars.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: D24006009MFSH SML4662X MZ MS FIRST TP CMagnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (StridesASvcs/Ins & 

Claims/Tx,RAC&PH) <Ana.Magnaye@stridespremier.com.sg>LAIM YOUR REF: SHD6313S OUR REF: SML4662Z 

  
Dear Chun Wei, 
  
SML4662X Vehicle in the workshop ? 
  

  
  

Best Regards, 

Rajes | Admin 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
  


