Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2024 11:13 AM

To: 'EileenNganYL@gbl.com.sg'

Cc: 'IsaacNgCL@gbl.com.sg’; 'jocelyn_ng@sg.msig-asia.com’; 'elaine_ngu@sg.msig-
asia.com’; Yan (LKK Auto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident involving SHD3415B and your insured YQ1171Y dated 04.07.2024 (MSIG
REF: 365635) *** LKK REF : CD/C4G000124070122/Aua3

Attachments: TP ESTIMATE - MARKED.pdf

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
We have inspected TP vehicle SHD3415B on 05.07.2024.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
. TP estimated cost of repair

Please note that our officer in charge is Yan.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Eileen Ngan Yi Ling <EileenNganYL@gbl.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, July 5, 2024 9:30 AM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@I|kkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Isaac Ng Cheng Long <IsaacNgCL@gbl.com.sg>; Jocelyn Ng <jocelyn ng@sg.msig-asia.com>; Elaine Ngu
<elaine_ngu@sg.msig-asia.com>

Subject: FW: Accident involving SHD3415B and your insured YQ1171Y dated 04.07.2024 (MSIG REF: 365635)

Dear All,
Please make arrangement for the PRI and if possible direct settlement on behalf of GBL.
Kindly acknowledge this email.

Thank you.



G 0 L D B E Goldbell Leasing Pte Ltd
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PLEASE BE REMINDED:

Using GOODS VEHICLE as a PUBLIC SERVICE VEHICLE '

and COLLECTING FARE without an official licence

ic NOT allnwad hv ITA Thank vanl — -
From: Jocelyn Ng <jocelyn ng@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2024 3:55 pm
To: Isaac Ng Cheng Long <IsaacNgCL@gbl.com.sg>
Cc: Eileen Ngan Yi Ling <EileenNganYL@gbl.com.sg>; Jasmine Tan Sze Ying <JasmineTanSY@gbl.com.sg>; Liu Guiben
<LiuGuiben@gbl.com.sg>; Elaine Ngu <elaine ngu@sg.msig-asia.com>
Subject: FW: Accident involving SHD3415B and your insured YQ1171Y dated 04.07.2024 (MSIG REF: 365635)

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

<Confidential>

Dear Isaac

Please advise if you would like to handle this case. Insured driver has yet to report the case.
TP repairer is ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd.

We attached third party’s accident report, repair estimate and letter to Ol informing TPD for your reference.

Thank you

Have a great week ahead!

Jocelyn Ng
Executive, Claims Services
D: +65 6012 1342 | jocelyn ng@sg.msig-asia.com

* Starting From 1 Oct 2023, MSIG will not accept any cheque payment anymore to support MAS's initiative on
elimination of cheques.
https://www.msig.com.sg/corporate-news/elimination-cheque-collection-1-october-2023
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é Join our mission in protecting our planet, please consider the environment before you print.

From: Lim Tien Siong <limts@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, July 4, 2024 1:52 PM

To: Motor Survey <motorsurvey@sg.msig-asia.com>

Subject: Accident involving SHD3415B and your insured YQ1171Y dated 04.07.2024

EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachment(s).

Officer in charge,

Best Regards,

Lim Tien Siong

Taxi Accident Repair / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off:62148398 / Fax:65468156
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From: canon@comfortdelgro.com.sg <canon@comfortdelgro.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2024 1:34 pm

To: Lim Tien Siong <limts@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: Scan Image

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us
and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is
not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a
binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement
signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to
print this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]




CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any person
other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended recipient,
please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.



