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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 11 July 2024 1:50 PM
To: bassitpt@gmail.com
Cc: Admin A
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 898G(CHINA TAIPING) AND SLJ 4685C AT/ALONG KJE 

LAMP POST NO. 369 ON 01/07/2024

Our Ref: CD/CTI24070111/Ama3 
 
 
M/S BASSI TRANSPORT SERVICES 
 
 
 
Dear PERSON IN CHARGE/ MOHAMAD SAHLAN BIN MOHAMAD SAM, 
                                                         
ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 898G(CHINA TAIPING) AND SLJ 4685C AT/ALONG KJE LAMP POST NO. 369 ON 
01/07/2024 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your 
motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.
 
We have received a claim from SLJ 4685C against your motor insurance policy. 
   
Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information 
given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed 
to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please 
contact us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that Sect II Excess applies under your policy. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler 

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphneLee@lkkauto.com|  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Pauline Tham (CTPIS) <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Monday, 7 April 2025 10:51 AM
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving  PA898G (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SLJ4685C 

(TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI24004705/Apa3) on  29/05/2024. Oref : SNM24D203834/c02

[Confidential] 

 
Hi Daphne 
  
Please proceed with your negotiation as proposed.  
  
Thanks. 
  
Pauline Tham 
Claims Department 
  
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6541   |   F: (65) 6224 7175 
   
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
  
  
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmiƩed with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidenƟal informaƟon. 
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or disseminaƟon of this message, either in whole or parƟal, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, 
please noƟfy the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereaŌer. 
  
From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 28 March 2025 11:43 
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Pauline Tham (CTPIS) <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA898G (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SLJ4685C (TP : LKK REF - 
CC6/CTI24004705/Apa3) on 29/05/2024. Oref : SNM24D203834/c02 
  

[Confidential] 

  

  

[Confidential] 

  
Your ref: SNM24D203834/c02 
LKK ref : CD/CTI24070111/Ama3 
  
Dear Pauline Tham, 
  

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 898G (CHINA TAIPING) AND SLJ 4685C (TP) ON 01/07/2024. 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
It is an accident under BOLA:28. 5 vehicles chain collision (OID 4th). We are of the view that liability is on our driver’s. 
  
We seek your approval to offer repairer “HD PERFECT AUTOWORK PTE LTD.” at $38,887.25 (all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
  

 Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
1. Cost of Repair  $ 88,526.22 $ 37,060.00 (L/S) W/GST 
2. Loss of Rental (30 days x $100.00) $   3,000.00 $    1,600.00 (16 days X $100.00) 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $         27.25 $         27.25 
4. Towing Fee $       200.00 $       200.00 

Total $ 91,753.47 $ 38,887.25 
  
  
Surveyor recommended 12 days for repair. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
  
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 23/01/2025 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
  
  
  
Best Regards, 
Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphneLee@lkkauto.com|  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
  
From: Pauline Tham (CTPIS) <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 9 October 2024 8:19 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA898G (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SLJ4685C (TP : LKK REF - 
CC6/CTI24004705/Apa3) on 29/05/2024. Oref : SNM24D203834/c02 
  

[Confidential] 

  
Hi Mei Kwan 
  
Third party had sent their LOD to us. 
  
Please follow up. 
  
Password sent separately.  
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