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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: EM Auto <emautosolution@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 August 2024 2:53 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: TP / SLT6182X / 365685

Hi Huey Yon 

 

We confirmed acceptance of  the revised offer of Lump Sum $4,350.00 (before GST). 

 

Regards. 

 

Serina Soon 
Senior Claim Executive 

 

Authorize Workshop Pte Ltd 
EM Solution Pte Ltd 
160 Sin Ming Drive 
#03-19 Sin Ming Autocity 
Singapore 575722 

Tel。64560226 

HP。92236288 

 

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) [mailto:hueyyon@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 7 August, 2024 12:09 PM 

To: emautosolution@singnet.com.sg 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: TP / SLT6182X / 365685 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

Without prejudice 

 

O�er lump sum $4,350.00 and 5 days. 
 

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


