Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Hong Lim <MeiHong.Lim@autoinsure.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2024 3:10 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Steve Chen (LKK Auto); SUR
Cc: Autolnsure

Subject: RE: SMM5278K -DOA:27/10/2023

Dear Veron,

We confirm COR $700 before gst and 3 repair days .
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Meihong

Century Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | é Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145.
TEL: 3157 2630

www.inchcape.com

@) Inchcape

inchcape.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 19, 2024 3:06 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; Mei Hong Lim <MeiHong.Lim@autoinsure.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SMM5278K -DOA:27/10/2023

Dear Mei Hong,
“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $700 with 3 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2024 1:00 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; MeiHong.Lim@autoinsure.com.sg
Cc: claims@autoinsure.com.sg

Subject: FW: SMM5278K -DOA:27/10/2023




Dear Steve,

Kindly assist finalize--CS/CT124070093/Evp3e2

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@I|kkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2024 12:44 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SMM5278K -DOA:27/10/2023

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Hong Lim <MeiHong.Lim@autoinsure.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2024 12:28 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@|kkauto.com>
Cc: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>

Subject: SMM5278K -DOA:27/10/2023

Hi Huey Yon & Steve,
We have attached the after-paint photos for your review.
Please let us have your offer soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Meihong

Century Moftors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | 6 Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145.
TEL: 3157 2630

www.inchcape.com
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