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Hueh Yin (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2024 3:53 PM
To: admin-d; SUR; assignments
Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Rick Teo; Chu Hui Yen; Paratal Shanthram Srinivas
Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10030309 /HY || OI- SMG4941S (Blue) TP- SFE8778P || Est: 

$0.00 || Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
Attachments: C10030309 - TP (SFE8778P).zip

Hi Team,  
 
Re-send email. Sorry for inconvenience caused. 
 
We would like to request TP survey for SFE8778P.  TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle. 
 
Workshop informaƟon:  
 

 
 
Please confirm assignment.   
 
Thank you. 
 
Warmest Regards, 
 
Srini 
Executive, Claims Administration 
 
T +65 6989 3694 
F +65 6725 0853   
E paratal.srinivas@budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 
Customer Care +65 6221 2111 
Claims +65 6221 2199 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 
Singapore Shopping Centre 
Singapore 
239924                                                                                                                                  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct 
Insurance. 
 
This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & 
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) 
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is 
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, 
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this 
email is unauthorised. 
 

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 3, 2024 10:56 AM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: PRI Request on 03.07.2024 || C10030309/HY || REQUEST FOR PRS - SFE8778P YOUR INSURED: SMG4941S 
DOA: 01.07.24 
 
Dear Frauleine, 
 
Please arrange for LKK to conduct the survey. 
 
 
Warmest regards, 
Steven 
Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd 
82636295 
 

  

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 3, 2024 10:19 AM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: REQUEST FOR PRS - SFE8778P YOUR INSURED: SMG4941S DOA: 01.07.24 

  

Dear Motor Claims Team, 

We refer to the attachments.  

Kindly assist to register our client’s TP claim and let us have your list of nominated surveyors within the next 2 working 
days from date of this email.  

Please respond soonest possible. 
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Warmest regards, 

Steven 

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd 

82636295 


