Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2024 9:22 AM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: Admin A

Subject: [SEEK MANDATE]- ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SMN4742 & GBK9816Y ON
01/07/2024

Attachments: TP GIA REPORT.pdf; LKK SURVEY REPORT & PHOTOS.pdf; SMN4742M LOD.pdf

Your ref: 24/24/24/VC05/029469
Our ref : CD/LPC24070049/Upa3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK9816Y(LONPAC) AND SMN4742M(TP) ON 01/07/2024

We refer to the above matter.
It is a head-to-rear collision. We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’s favour.

We seek your approval to offer repairer “JOO HAK KEE AUTO PTE LTD" at $6,106.18 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed | Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair (with 9% GST) $14,733.49 $ 5,450.00 ($5,000.00 + 9% GST)
2. Loss of RENTAL (6days x $120.00)(with 9%GST) | S  784.80 S 654.00 (6DAYS X $100.00)(+9%GST)
3. LTA/GIA SERACH FEE S 2.18 S 2.18
Total | $ 15,520.47 $6,106.18

Surveyor recommended 5days for repair +1SUNDAY = 6DAYS.

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 13/08/2024 is only for mandate purpose.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, July 19, 2024 3:13 PM
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>



Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: NEW DIRECT SETTLEMENT - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SMN4742 & GBK9816Y ON 01/07/2024

Dear Sirs/ Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed for your perusal is: -

. Estimated cost of repair
. Preliminary advice
. Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 2, 2024 3:02 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assighnments <assignments@|kkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG
<mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: NEW DIRECT SETTLEMENT - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SMN4742 & GBK9816Y ON 01/07/2024

Dear Gerald,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 2, 2024 2:51 PM

To: 'yvonneang@jhk.com.sg' <yvonneang@jhk.com.sg>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@l|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: NEW DIRECT SETTLEMENT - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SMN4742 & GBK9816Y ON 01/07/2024

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General



WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Yvonne,
Our insured has not lodged the report. For liability clearance, please liaise with the surveyors.

Since your workshop is on the list of panel for ARC, we would not be furnishing you our list of
surveyors.

In the meantime, we shall appoint LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for the survey.

Aside to LKK - Attn : Rajes
FYNA
Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Yvonne Ang <yvonneang@jhk.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, July 2, 2024 2:21 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: NEW DIRECT SETTLEMENT - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SMN4742 & GBK9816Y ON 01/07/2024

Dear Sir/Madam

Kindly arrange a pre-repair survey for the above and if possible would like to do direct
settlement.

Please provide us your list of surveyors for our selection.
We're in the midst of preparing the estimate.
Enclosed a copy of the SAS.

Kindly advise on liability

Details as follows

Name of Workshop : Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd

Address of Survey Location : | 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-406 Singapore 408701




Name of Contact Person : YVONNE ANG

Contact Number : HP: 97968989 Office: 67431913

Vehicle in workshop: YES

Yvonne Ang (Ms)

Business Operations Manager
Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd
3007 Ubi Rd 1

#01-406

Singapore 408701

HP: 9796 8989 Office: 6743 1913 Fax: 6743 5234

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.



