Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Attachment <twinauto@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 13 September 2024 9:36 AM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: PENDING OF FINALISATON : GBJ 4534 Z

Hi, we accepted this offer. Thanks

EEVON
Twin Wheels Auto Trading Enterprise
Tel: 67652616

On,Thu Sep 12 2024 15:02:44 GMT+0800 (Singapore Standard Time), Huey Yon
(LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> wrote:

---------- Original Message ----------

Dear Eevon,

Please take note that our principle had offered lump sum $900.00 ( max) of repair cost.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From:

Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 September 2024 3:46 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: PENDING OF FINALISATON : GBJ 4534 Z

From: Attachment <twinauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 September 2024 3:45:52 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PENDING OF FINALISATON : GBJ 4534 Z

Hi, our last proposed the offer $1,000.00

Thanks

EEVON
Twin Wheels Auto Trading Enterprise
Tel: 6765 2616

On ,Wed Sep 11 2024 11:55:26 GMT+0800 (Singapore Standard Time),
Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:
---------- Original Message ----------




Hi Eevon,

We have informed MSIG on your proposition below, they have replied and
offered COR LS $900, 3 DAYS.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From:

Attachment <twinauto@singnet.com.sg>
Sent:

Tuesday, 27 August 2024 4:00 pm

To:

Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>
Subject:

RE: PENDING OF FINALISATON : GBJ 4534 Z

Hi, our propose the item of spare parts from as below :

2. REAR R/H SAFETY LOCK
5. REAR LAMP R/H

Thanks

EEVON
Twin Wheels Auto Trading Enterprise
Tel: 6765 2616

On ,Tue Aug 27 2024 15:17:50 GMT+0800 (Singapore
Standard Time), Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
wrote:

Please refer attached, recommended from MSIG, COR /s $730,

3 days.

From the accident scene photo attached, the other vehicle side

swipe the rear side of the lorry, not direct impact to the rear right
portion.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From:

Attachment <twinauto@singnet.com.sg>
Sent:

Thursday, 22 August 2024 12:02 pm

To:

Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>
Subject:




RE: PENDING OF FINALISATON : GBJ 4534 7
Noted with thanks

EEVON
Twin Wheels Auto Trading Enterprise
Tel: 6765 2616

On ,Thu Aug 22 2024 11:57:52 GMT+0800
(Singapore Standard Time), Taufikh
(LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:
---------- Original Message ----------

Hi Eevon,

We need to seek approval from MSIG for the
repair cost, will update once approved.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From:

Attachment <twinauto@singnet.com.sg>
Sent:

Thursday, August 22, 2024 9:28 AM

To:

Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>
Subject:

RE: PENDING OF FINALISATON : GBJ 4534 7

Hi, please refer your attachment file. Thanks

EEVON
Twin Wheels Auto Trading Enterprise
Tel: 67652616

On ,Wed Aug 21 2024 17:33:23
GMT+0800 (Singapore
Standard Time), Taufikh
(LKKAuto)
<Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:
---------- Original Message ------

Hi Eevon,

Can forward me the after repair
photos?



Regards
Taufikh

From:

Attachment
<twinauto@singnet.com.sg>
Sent:

Tuesday, August 20, 2024 12:38 PM
To:

Finalization
<finalization@Ikkauto.com>

Cc:

Taufikh (LKKAuto)
<Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject:

PENDING OF FINALISATON : GBJ
45347

Hi, any update for the
finalisation???

EEVON

Twin Wheels Auto Trading
Enterprise

Tel: 6765 2616



