From: Sinmotor Repairs <sinmotorl1234@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 28 February 2025 4:02 PM

To: mt_claim@longpac.com; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Fwd: SJY8118S n ur insured YP412P - TP Medical receipt

HiYan,

We would like to revise our offer as follows :-

Invoice - 129/SM DD24/01/2025 - $4,400.00 + $ 396/- (GST)

Loss of Use $720.00 (4 Days @ $180/-)

Pinnacle Family Clinic - $26.50 (Medical Fees)

Our Bank : UOB Bank and Paynow by UEN - 07683000D

Your early attention is much appreciated.

Thanks n Regards,

June Ong/ 91820355, 6453 3908 - SIN MOTOR REPAIRS



LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

RE: DATE OF ACCIDENT : 30/12/2024 AT 0834 AM
ALONG CTE TWDS CITY, SLIP ROAD TO AMK AVE 1
OUR INSURED VEHICLE NO. SJY8118S - T/P

I, Mr, [‘ Im éb@@'}\\ (./Héjz’,‘jdlc no. S 8®“*§ 3 P> ’ , hereby authorise,

Sin Motor Repairs to carry out the above T/P accident claims and
the repair works arising from the accident.
I confirm that my vehicle was repaired by your work shop to my full

satisfaction.

Upon completion, | have collected my vehicle on }& January 2025

5P

( 8 R e
Signature of Owner : LIM BOON CHERN

Date : |0 /01/2025 B W e
SIN MOT: @ RIJAIRS

BT
Witnessed by :

(Signature of the representative of the repairer)



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

4R4125/VCO0030379 [
{ 10MARCH 2025~ -

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, LIM BOON CHERN confirmed scceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of YP412P the sum of Singapore Dollar Five
Thousand One Hundred Ninety Six Only (85,196.00) in full and final satisfaction,
liquidaticn and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us
whether now or hercafter to become manifest, arising cither directly or indirectly from
an accident involving SJY8118S and YP412P on 30/12/2024 along/at CTE TWDS
CITY, SLIP ROAD TO AMK AVE 1.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ JIA MEI TRADING (S) PTE LTD ANI/OR ZHAO QINGZHU) against
al claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persans on our behalf in
respect of the said accident

I/We further authorize you w pay the above settlement sum directly to “SIN
MOTOR REPAIRS”.

I/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related ¢laims and in respect of our
insured’s recavery action.

o SRR 202,

gnature of vehicle owner/Date =3

R AR 2605

Name of vehicle owner /Date P

LWL ROON) CHE



meikwan
Stamp


Sin Motor Repairs

Block 176, #05-07, Sin Ming Drive, Sin Ming Auto Care
Singapore 575721

Tel: 64533908, 64596902 Fax: 64536602
G.S.T. REGISTRATION : 07683000D 24/1/2025

T/P FINAL BILL - 129/SM
AGAINST YOUR INSURED VEHICLE NO. YP412P
THIRD PARTY INSURANCE: LONPAC INSURANCE SINGAPORE - 62507388

THE INSURED / DRIVER : VEHICLE NO. SJY8118S

MR LIM BOON CHERN DATE OF ACCIDENT : 30/12/2024- 08430AM
BLK 984B BUANGKOK LINK CTE TWDS CITY, SLIP ROAD TO AMK AVE 1
#14-23 SINGAPORE SINGAPORE

MP : 9766 6778 MODEL : BMW 520l

SING LIFE LTD INSURANCE CHASIS NO. WBAS5A32070D829428

POLICY NO. 13274673

TO REPLACE REAR BOOT LID, REAR BUMPER, REINFORCEMENT, BOOT LAMP LH N CLIPS
LABOUR CHARGES ALL IN - REFIXING AND SPRAY PAINTING

LUMP SUM FOR THE ABOVE 4,400.00
4,400.00

ADD 9% G.S.T. 396.00

G-TOTAL : 4,796.00

(SINGAPORE DOLLARS. FOUR THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED AND
NINETY SIX ONLY)



6256431

To:

MOTOR_AEPAIRS

Bank Account Detalls .

e MoToA REPAIRS
/ THOMSN) RRANCH

Beneficiary Neme:

Swift Codo

Emall Address: n : ! f - GO

(For netlification of paymont detalls)

Name/Designation/Telephone/Email of Contact person.;

aensoa) LI /PA R [ ainmeloy 123
/ ' © ﬂwm] o

ominated account,

Name / Date:




Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO®@Ilonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, March 7, 2025 2:58 PM

To: Yan (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: OUR REF: 24/24/25/VC00/030379  LKK REF: CD/LPC24120443/Kua3
Attachments: Re: SJY8118S n ur insured YP412P - TP Medical receipt *** LKK REF:

CD/LPC24120443/Kua3qg2(N)

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

Dear Yan,

You have our mandate to settle as follow.

Cost of repair $4,796.00

Loss of use $480.00 - $600.00

Medical expense fee $0.00

Total $5,276.00 - $5,396.00
Thank you.

Best Regards

Eric Woo

Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all CHew" lonpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.



From: Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 February 2025 3:05 pm

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO®@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] RE: OUR REF: 24/24/25/VC00/030379 LKK REF: CD/LPC24120443/Kua3

Lonpac External - General

Caution: This email is from an external sender. DO NOT click links or open attachments if you do not recognize the sender.

Your ref: 24/24/25/VC00/030379
Our ref : CD/LPC24120443/Kua3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 412P(LONPAC) AND SJY 8118S(TP) ON 30/12/2024

We refer to the above matter.
We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’s favour as insured rear ended third party vehicle.

We seek your approval to offer repairer “SIN MOTOR REPAIRS” at $5,422.50(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed | Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair $ 9,597.40 S 4,796.00 ($4,400.00 + 9%GST)
2. Loss of RENTAL (4days x $180.00) S 720.00 S 600.00 (4DAYS X $150.00)
3. Medical bill S 26.50 S 26.50
Total | $10.343.90 $ 5,422.50

Surveyor recommended 4days for repair.

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 24/02/2025 is only for mandate purpose.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

Best Regards,
Yan

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Email: yan@lkkauto.com| DID: 6841-6051 | fax: 6256-4315



Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@Ionpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2025 9:26 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; Gerald Poh Email Forwarding <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: OUR REF: 24/24/25/VC00/030379 LKK REF: CD/LPC24120443/Kua3

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

Dear Mei Kwan,

Please refer to attached OI GIA.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Eric Woo

Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all CNeW? |[onpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2025 6:24 pm

To: Gerald Poh Email Forwarding <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@Ikkauto.com>




Subject: RE: FW: Third Party Accident involving our insured car SJY8118S n ur Lorry YP412P on 30-12-2024
(10087542_110300.pdf *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24120443/Kua3

Lonpac External - General

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 January 2025 11:11 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: FW: Third Party Accident involving our insured car SJY8118S n ur Lorry YP412P on 30-12-2024
(10087542_110300.pdf *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24120443/Kua3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

. TP estimated cost of repair
J Preliminary advice
J Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Please note that our officer in charge is Yan.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto) <huehyin@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 December 2024 2:32 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: FW: Third Party Accident involving our insured car SJY8118S n ur Lorry YP412P on 30-12-2024
(10087542_110300.pdf

Dear Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that the vehicle notin the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Wonderful Clnistmas Fappy WNew Year 2025\

Best Regards,
Hueh Yin | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, December 30, 2024 2:03 PM

To: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto) <huehyin@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Sinmotor Repairs
<sinmotorl1234@gmail.com>

Subject: FW: FW: Third Party Accident involving our insured car SJY8118S n ur Lorry YP412P on 30-12-2024
(10087542_110300.pdf

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General



Dear Hueh Yin,

FYNA. Insured yet to report.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Sinmotor Repairs <sinmotorl234@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 December 2024 2:08 pm

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: Re: FW: Third Party Accident involving our insured car SJY8118S n ur Lorry YP412P on 30-12-2024
(10087542_110300.pdf

Hi Eric,

We would like to appoint LKK Auto for PSl inspection.
Please arrange.

Regards,

June Ong/
9182 0355

On Mon, 30 Dec 2024 at 13:53, GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - General
Lonpac External - General

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear June,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle and enclose the names
of our Motor surveyor firms your attention:-

1. FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd
2. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please let us hear from you within the next 2 working days.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Sinmotor Repairs <sinmotor1234@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 December 2024 1:51 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@I|onpac.com>

Subject: Fwd: Third Party Accident involving our insured car SJY8118S n ur Lorry YP412P on 30-12-2024
(10087542_110300.pdf




—————————— Forwarded message ---------
From: Sinmotor Repairs <sinmotor1234@gmail.com>

Date: Mon, 30 Dec 2024 at 13:04

Subject: Fwd: Third Party Accident involving our insured car SJY8118S n ur Lorry YP412P on 30-12-2024
(10087542_110300.pdf

To: <mt_claim@longpac.com>

Cc: June Ong <juneong1964@gmail.com>

Hi Officer / Motor Claims Team,

Subject: Third Party Accident involving our insured car SJY8118S n ur Lorry YP412P

on 30-12-2024 (10087542_110300.pdf

We, the third party workshop. SIN MOTOR REPAIRS would like to submit the above third party claims.

Kindly arrange and call us in advance for the surveyor of PSl inspection.

Currently, our insured car is notin yet.

(Please find attachment of Full Accident Report and two Video for your reference)

PW: SJY8118S1153B

Thanks n Regards,



Sin Motor Repairs,

Blk 176 SIN MONG DRIVE

UNIT 05-07 SIN MING AUTOCARE

SINGAPORE 575721

June Ong /9182 3055 or

Benson Lim /9633 7027

Sent from my iPhone
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