Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Claims - Soon Lee <claims-sl@completevms.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 July 2025 5:14 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Tian Yuh Sia; Darren Chiu; Gan Li Hui; Soon Lee VMS; Huey Yon (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: Request For Finalized | SKZ5611L DOA: 11/12/2024

"Without Prejudice”

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We accept your COR $1600 (before gst)

Best Regards,

3 I Stevania | Claims Admin
Complete VMS Pte. Ltd.
5, Soon Lee Street, #01-54, Pioneer Point, S627607
D (65) 6555 6111
W https://www.completevms.com.sg

On Fri, Jul 4, 2025 at 10:58 AM Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

Please refer attached, COR /s $1600, 2 days.



Subject to insurance approval.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Claims - Soon Lee <claims-sl@completevms.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 27 June 2025 4:42 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Tian Yuh Sia <sia@completevms.com.sg>; Darren Chiu <darren@completevms.com.sg>; Gan Li Hui <lihui@completevms.com.sg>; Soon Lee VMS
<soonlee@completevms.com.sg>

Subject: Request For Finalized | SKZ5611L DOA: 11/12/2024

"Without Prejudice”

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

Please find the above After Repair photo for your reference.

Kindly proceed to finalize and provide the calculated final estimate at your earliest convenience.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Stevania | Claims Admin

Complete VMS Pte. Ltd.

5, Soon Lee Street, #01-54, Pioneer Point, S627607
D (65) 6555 6111

W https://www.completevms.com.sg




