Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Billy <billy@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2025 2:45 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SJP7188T - Finalize

Best Regard's
Billy Liaw

MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: +65 62723892
Fax: +65 62708314

Connect with us on

————— Original Message-----

From: Billy <billy@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 January 2025 9:01 am

To: 'Steve Chen (LKK Auto)' <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Jia Yu' <jiayu@mova.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SJP7188T - Finalize

Hi Sir,
Confirm, Thank you.

Best Regard's
Billy Liaw

MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: +65 62723892
Fax: +65 62708314

Connect with us on

----- Original Message-----

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 6 January 2025 9:48 pm

To: Billy <billy@mova.com.sg>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SIP7188T - Finalize

Hi Billy,
Kindly refer our finalize $2800.00 (L/S, before GST). 4 days. (Subject to insurance approval)

Please confirm.



Thanks and regards,

Steve Chen

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: stevechen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

————— Original Message-----

From: Billy <billy@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 6 January 2025 12:09 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SJP7188T

From: Billy <billy@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 6 January 2025 8:48 am

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SIP7188T

Hi Steve,
Attach with Finalization Report, Please advise. Thank you.

Best Regard's
Billy Liaw



