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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 18 September 2024 11:20 AM
To: Natarajan Kavidha Rajan; assignments
Cc: Claims; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Rick Teo
Subject: RE: TPPD Survey : Claim Ref: C10030223/KR || OI–SKU2600P (Grey) TP-SLF6757L || 

Ests: $0.00 || E M Solution Pte Ltd

Dear Kavidha, 
 
Please be informed that according to the repairer, owner already withdraw the claim. 
 
No survey was done for this vehicle. 
 
We will close this file at our end without billing. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Hueh Yin | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, September 12, 2024 5:09 PM 
To: Natarajan Kavidha Rajan <kavidha.n@budgetdirect.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments 
<assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: TPPD Survey : Claim Ref: C10030223/KR || OI–SKU2600P (Grey) TP-SLF6757L || Ests: $0.00 || E M 
Solution Pte Ltd 
 
Dear Kavidha, 

 

Please be informed that according to the repairer pending survey arrangement from owner. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Rajes | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Natarajan Kavidha Rajan <kavidha.n@budgetdirect.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, August 23, 2024 5:15 PM 
To: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
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Subject: RE: TPPD Survey : Claim Ref: C10030223/KR || OI–SKU2600P (Grey) TP-SLF6757L || Ests: $0.00 || E M 
Solution Pte Ltd 
 
Dear Team, 
 
Please advise us the status of this case. 
 
Kavidha  
Executive, Claims 
T +65 6989 3693 
E kavidha.n@budgetdirect.com.sg  
 

 
 
Customer Care +65 6221 2111 
Claims +65 6221 2199 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
                                                                              
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01  
Singapore Shopping Centre  
Singapore 239924  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
  

 
 
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance. 
 
Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged information. If you are 
not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete 
the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 
Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

 
 

From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, July 1, 2024 4:22 PM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Derrick Quok <derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Rick Teo 
<rick.teo@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Natarajan Kavidha Rajan <kavidha.n@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: TPPD Survey : Claim Ref: C10030223/KR || OI–SKU2600P (Grey) TP-SLF6757L || Ests: $0.00 || E M 
Solution Pte Ltd 
 
Dear Michael, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Rajes | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, July 1, 2024 3:59 PM 
To: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Derrick Quok <derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Rick Teo 
<rick.teo@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Natarajan Kavidha Rajan <kavidha.n@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: TPPD Survey : Claim Ref: C10030223/KR || OI–SKU2600P (Grey) TP-SLF6757L || Ests: $0.00 || E M Solution 
Pte Ltd 
 

Dear Team, 

We would like to request TP survey for TP VEH NO SLF6757L. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.  

Workshop:  

 

Please confirm assignment. 

Thank you. 
 
Warmest Regards, 
Michael 
Executive, Claims Administration 
 
T +65 6989 3704 
F +65 6725 0853  
E jinghou.chin@budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 
Customer Care +65 6221 2111 
Claims +65 6221 2199 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 
Singapore Shopping Centre 
Singapore 239924  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget 
Direct Insurance. 
 
This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & 
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) 
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is 
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, 
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this 
email is unauthorised. 
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From: Hui Ting Tang <huiting@crossbordersllc.com>  
Sent: Monday, July 1, 2024 2:27 PM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Cc: Corene Chong <corene@crossbordersllc.com> 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: TK.EMS.SLF6757L - PRS Request 01.07.2024 || C10030223/KR || RE: accident involving 
SLF6757L/SKU2600P on 27/6/24 
 
Your attention is drawn to the CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE below. 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
Dear Sirs/Madam 
 
1. We refer to your email attached below. 
 
2. We are instructed that our client has confirmed LKK Auto Consultants as single joint expert. 
 
3. Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at: 
 

Venue: E M Solution Pte Ltd 
Address: 160, Sin Ming Drive 

Sin Ming Autocity, #03-19 
Singapore 575722 

Contact: Jojo/Serina @ 6456 0226 
 
4. Please liaise with the above workshop directly. 
 
 
Thank You.  
 
Regards 
Huiting  
TEL: 6438 1323 ext 2006 
CrossBorders LLC 
133 New Bridge Road 
#23-03/04/05 Chinatown Point 
Singapore 059413 
Tel: (65) 6438 1323 
Fax: (65) 6438 2313 
 
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE 
This e-mail from CrossBorders LLC (including any attachment(s) to it) is confidential and may also be privileged and 
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. Accordingly, if you are not the intended recipient please notify us 
immediately, delete this e-mail (including any attachment to it) from your computer system and do not disclose or 
distribute it to any other person or continue to read this e-mail. Thank you. 
 
CrossBorders LLC DOES NOT ACCEPT SERVICE OF COURT DOCUMENTS OR NOTICE OF ANY 
PROCEEDINGS BY FACSIMILE OR EMAIL 
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From: Hui Ting Tang <huiting@crossbordersllc.com>  
Sent: Friday, June 28, 2024 4:54 PM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Cc: Corene Chong <corene@crossbordersllc.com> 
Subject: Our Ref: TK.EMS.SLF6757L; Your insured veh: SKU2600P (AGI); DOA: 27/06/2024 - PRI Notice 
Importance: High 
 
Your attention is drawn to the CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE below. 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
VERY URGENT  
 
TO: Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 
 
Dear Sirs/Madam 
 
NOTICE TO INSURER TO CONDUCT PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION  
CLAIMANT: YAN BEE NAH 
TRAFFIC ACCIDENT ON 27 JUNE 2024 AT 13:45 HRS ALONG 18 TAI SENG BUILDING, CARPARK EXIT (BEFORE 
BARRIER) INVOLVING VEHICLES NO. SLF6757L & SKU2600P 
 
We are instructed by YAN BEE NAH to notify you of a road accident on 27 JUNE 2024 at about 13:45 hrs along 18 TAI 
SENG BUILDING, CARPARK EXIT (BEFORE BARRIER) involving our client’s vehicle registration number SLF6757L 
and vehicle registration number SKU2600P driven by your insured at the material time. A copy of the Singapore 
accident statement/traffic police report filed is enclosed. 
 
As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceeds to repair the damaged 
vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days (excluding any intervening Saturday, Sunday and Public Holiday) of 
your receipt of this notice whether you or your insurer would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do 
not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without 
further reference to you. 
 
Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at:  
 

Venue: E M Solution Pte Ltd 
Address: 160, Sin Ming Drive 

Sin Ming Autocity, #03-19 
Singapore 575722 

Contact: Jojo/Serina @ 6456 0226 
 

Please revert accordingly.  
 
Thank You.  
 
Regards 
Huiting  
TEL: 6438 1323 ext 2006 
CrossBorders LLC 
133 New Bridge Road 
#23-03/04/05 Chinatown Point 
Singapore 059413 
Tel: (65) 6438 1323 
Fax: (65) 6438 2313 
 
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE 
This e-mail from CrossBorders LLC (including any attachment(s) to it) is confidential and may also be privileged and 
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. Accordingly, if you are not the intended recipient please notify us 
immediately, delete this e-mail (including any attachment to it) from your computer system and do not disclose or 
distribute it to any other person or continue to read this e-mail. Thank you. 
 
CrossBorders LLC DOES NOT ACCEPT SERVICE OF COURT DOCUMENTS OR NOTICE OF ANY 
PROCEEDINGS BY FACSIMILE OR EMAIL 
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