Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 1 July 2024 5:12 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Maryam Abdul Rahman; assignments
Subject: RE: Enquiry on motorcycle damage accident surveyor

Dear Bryan,

Noted with thanks.

We will arrange accordingly.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, July 1, 2024 1:07 PM

To: Maryam Abdul Rahman <maryam.rahman@live.co.uk>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Enquiry on motorcycle damage accident surveyor

Hi

Payment can be done via paynow once our report is completed. My accounts will email to you our invoice
with bank details once ready.

Dear Assignment Team
Please arrange for survey FBP 4788B as per below email. Total loss case.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Maryam Abdul Rahman <maryam.rahman@live.co.uk>

Sent: Friday, June 28, 2024 5:35 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Enquiry on motorcycle damage accident surveyor

Hi Bryan,
Ok iwould like to proceed with your service.
My bike is currently located at 25 kaki bukit rd 4 #01-30, synergy@kb (TUCK LIFE RACING)

How do i proceed with the payment?



Hope to hear from you soon.
Thank you.

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 25, 2024 5:48:30 PM

To: Maryam Abdul Rahman <maryam.rahman@live.co.uk>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Enquiry on motorcycle damage accident surveyor

Hi

Our professional fee to carry out an inspection and put up a report of the Market Value of the bike will be
$280/- (exclude gst).

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Maryam Abdul Rahman <maryam.rahman@live.co.uk>

Sent: Tuesday, June 25, 2024 2:44 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Enquiry on motorcycle damage accident surveyor

Hi there,

It will be FBP4788B9121G.

Bike has not been repaired as its under total lost. It is now at Tuck Life in Synergy, kaki bukit.
No quotation has been given from the mechanics as its total lost.

Thank you.

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 25, 2024 12:31:53 PM

To: Maryam Abdul Rahman <maryam.rahman@live.co.uk>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Enquiry on motorcycle damage accident surveyor

Hi
Refer to your enquiry below.
We have not received the password for the accident report.

Meanwhile, please advice has the bike been repaired? If no, then where is the bike lying at now? Is there
an estimate cost of repair given by the workshop for the bike?
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Will provide a quote of our fees thereafter.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Maryam Abdul Rahman <maryam.rahman@live.co.uk>
Sent: Monday, June 24, 2024 5:07 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Enquiry on motorcycle damage accident surveyor

Hi Bryan,

My name is Maryam and I'm looking to engage a surveyor. My friend earlier called in to your office and
they referred me to email to you. | have hired a lawyer for my case and | just need the damage assessment
to claim the amount for my case of accident. | was on a motorcycle and | got into an accident with a bus on
27 Nov 2023 at a junction in Pasir Ris.

| would like to enquire on the costs as well as the process and anything that is able to help expedite this
matter. | have attached the Full Accident Report in this email. | will send the password to the file in a
separate email. Hope to hear from you soon.

Best Regards,
Maryam



