Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 October 2025 5:23 PM

To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: DV - Accident Involving SNQ2915S & SHD6516Z (DOA: 16/12/2024) ***LKK Ref:
CD/FCI24120324/Ama3qg2(N)

Attachments: SNQ2519S TOYOTA SIENTA_SIGNED DV.pdf

Hi Daphne,

Please find the attached signed DV and bank details as followed :

Company Name : KT MOTORWERK

Address : Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978
Remittance Attention To

Email & Contact Number : KTMOTORWERK@HOTMAIL.COM

Bank Transfer Details
Beneficiary : KT MOTORWERK
Bank Name : UOB

Bank Address : UOB BEDOK
Bank Code : 7375

Branch Code : 027

SWIFT Code : UOVBSGSG

Bank Account No. : 3483137808
Currency SG

Thank you

Regards,

John Tee,

HP:98287487

KT MOTORWERK

ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 16 October 2025 10:34 am

To: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>

Subject: RE: DV - Accident Involving SNQ2915S & SHD6516Z (DOA: 16/12/2024) ***LKK Ref:
CD/FCI24120324/Ama3qg2(N)

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir/ Madam,

Please duly sign the document enclosed and return to us for our necessary action.

Thank you



