
ELITE AUTO RESTORATION PTE LTE

Letter of Demand

Our Ref: SMZ365G

23/4/2025

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

16 Raffles Quay

#42-01 Hong Leong Building
Singapore (048581)

Dear Sir/Mdm:

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMZ365G & SHB2135B ALONG PIE TOWARDS CHANGI ON

18/12/2024

We are acting on behalf of the owner/driver to recover his vehicle damages and losses

sustainer in the above accident from the third party driver/ or insurers.

Repair Costs

Loss Of Rental

LTA Search Fee

Description Amount

$ 5,668.00

$120.00 X 8 days $ 960.00

Amount $ 6,628.00

Please look into our client claims and let us hear from you shortly.

Thank you

NANCY

XIN HUA WORKSHOP PTE LTD

Tel: 8898 3739

email: xinhuaworkshop@gmail.com







Invoice
# EINV-0180

ELITE AUTO RESTORATION PTE LTD UEN&GST No: 202424577D

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #04-01, Singapore 415933  n Tel: +65 6721 9017  n Email: eliteautorestore.sg@gmail.com

Bill To:

Invoice Date :  2025-06-18

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

16 RAFFLES QUAY

#42-01 HONG LEONG BUILDING

SINGAPORE 048581

Invoice Due Date : 2025-06-18

Reference : SMZ365G

# Description Qty Amount

1 SMZ365G - HONDA CIVIC

DATE OF ACCIDENT : 18/12/2024

LUMP SUM REPAIR FOR THIRD PARTY CLAIM

1.00 5,200.00

Sub Total 5,200.00

Total GST 9% 468.00

Total SGD 5,668.00









  

Company Name      
Address      
Remittance Attention To 
Email & Contact Number 

 
    

 
Bank Transfer Details  

Beneficiary      
Bank Name      
Bank Address      
Bank Code        
Branch Code        
SWIFT Code      
Bank Account No.      
Currency SGD       

ELITE AUTO RESTORATION PTE LTD

23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 #04-01 S 415933

ELITEAUTORESTORE.SG@GMAIL.COM

OCBCSGSG

5968-0697-6001

$6,500.00

596

7339

OCBC

ELITE AUTO RESTORATION PTE LTD
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Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, June 11, 2025 5:26 PM
To: Yan (LKK Auto)
Cc: CS A Team
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] RE: MSFCIL Ref: D24011124MFCT/CCPL/TPD-2/KT - ACC INVOLVING SHB2135B AND SMZ365G ON 

18.12.2024 *** LKK REF: CD/FCI24120320/Aua3(N)
Attachments: LKK SURVEY REPORT & PHOTOS_365.pdf; LOD 365.pdf

Dear Yan, 
 
Our mandate as follows: 
  

Amount Claimed Amount Revised MSFC mandate 
1. Cost of Repair $ 12,818.16 $ 5,668.00 ($5,200.00 + 9%GST) $ 5,668.00 ($5,200.00 + 9%GST)
2. Loss of Rental (8days x $120.00) $      960.00 $    960.00 (8DAYS X $120.00) $    840.00 to 960.00 (7

Total $ 13,778.16 $ 6,628.00 $ 6,508.00 to 6,628.00
   
 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Karen Tan 
Motor Claims Dept. 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 16 Raffles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building Singapore 048581 | DID : 6359 1805 |  Fax 
No. : 6223 0541 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C 

 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details 
of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, 
forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 
From: Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 9 June 2025 1:37 pm 
To: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] RE: MSFCIL Ref: D24011124MFCT/CCPL/TPD-2/KT - ACC INVOLVING SHB2135B AND SMZ365G 
ON 18.12.2024 *** LKK REF: CD/FCI24120320/Aua3(N) 
 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening 
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

 
Your ref: D24011124MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 
Our ref : CD/FCI24120320/Aua3 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 2135B(MS FCIL) AND SMZ 365G(TP) ON 18/12/2024 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’s favour as he rear ended third party vehicle. 
  
We seek your approval to offer repairer “ELITE AUTO RESTORATION PTE LTD" at $6,628.00(all-in). 
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The summary is as follows: - 
   

Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
1. Cost of Repair $ 12,818.16 $ 5,668.00 ($5,200.00 + 9%GST) 
2. Loss of Rental (8days x $120.00) $      960.00 $    960.00 (8DAYS X $120.00) 

Total $ 13,778.16 $ 6,628.00 
   
Surveyor recommended 6days for repair. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 06/06/2025 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 
 
 
For future correspondence, please remove meikwan@lkkauto.com and admin-a@lkkauto.com in your email. Thanks. 
 
Best Regards, 
Yan 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Email: yan@lkkauto.com| DID: 6841-6051 | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, January 28, 2025 10:01 AM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: MSFCIL Ref: D24011124MFCT/CCPL/TPD-2/KT - ACC INVOLVING SHB2135B AND SMZ365G ON 18.12.2024 *** 
LKK REF: CD/FCI24120320/Aua3(N) 
 
Dear Mei Kwan, 
 
My apologies. The workshop has quoted under the wrong claim reference number.  
 
Please discard the email.  
 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Karen Tan 
Motor Claims Dept. 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 16 Raffles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building Singapore 048581 | DID : 6359 1805 |  Fax 
No. : 6223 0541 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C 
 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom 
it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please 
delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, January 27, 2025 6:19 PM 
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To: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: MSFCIL Ref: D24011124MFCT/CCPL/TPD-2/KT - ACC INVOLVING SHB2135B AND SMZ365G ON 18.12.2024 *** 
LKK REF: CD/FCI24120320/Aua3(N) 
 
Hi Karen, 
 
The LOD attached is not belong to SMZ365G.  
 
Please confirm. 
 
Hi Yan, 
 
Please ignore my previous email. 
 
Wishing You a Prosperous & Joyful Chinese New Year 2025! 
 
Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
Mei Kwan | Admin 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Monday, January 27, 2025 6:15 PM 
To: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: MSFCIL Ref: D24011124MFCT/CCPL/TPD-2/KT - ACC INVOLVING SHB2135B AND SMZ365G ON 18.12.2024 *** 
LKK REF: CD/FCI24120320/Aua3(N) 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
Thank you for your email. 
  
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
  
Hi Yan, 
 
Kindly assist. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Wishing You a Prosperous & Joyful Chinese New Year 2025! 
 
Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
Mei Kwan | Admin 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, January 27, 2025 2:28 PM 
To: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
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Subject: MSFCIL Ref: D24011124MFCT/CCPL/TPD-2/KT - ACC INVOLVING SHB2135B AND SMZ365G ON 18.12.2024 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We have received the attached LOD. Fyna pls. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Karen Tan 
Motor Claims Dept. 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 16 Raffles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building Singapore 048581 | DID : 6359 1805 |  Fax 
No. : 6223 0541 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C 
 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom 
it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please 
delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Friday, December 20, 2024 10:01 AM 
To: Swee Keong Teo <SweeKeongTeo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A 
<admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT MSFCIL Ref: D24011124MFCT/CCPL/TPD-2/KT 
 
Dear Swee Keong, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
 
Cheers to a Wonderful Christmas and a Happy New Year 2025 ! 
 
Best Regards, 
Rajes | Admin 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 
#02-25 | S(408933) 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Swee Keong Teo <SweeKeongTeo@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, December 19, 2024 5:36 PM 
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; eliteautorestore.sg@gmail.com 
Subject: NEW ASSIGNMENT MSFCIL Ref: D24011124MFCT/CCPL/TPD-2/KT 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
Please find attached documents for survey assignment. 
 
 
Insured Vehicle No : SHB2135B 
TP Vehicle No      : SMZ365G 
Claim No           : D24011124MFCT 
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Workshop Name      : ELITE AUTO RESTORATION PTE LTD 
Our Surveyor       : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 
Instructions       : Direct Settlement (Subject to quantum to be agreed) 
 
Created By         : TEOSWEE 
Verified By        : KARENT 
Approved By        : KARENT 
 
 
 
This is a computer generated mail. Do not reply to this mail. 
 
 
 


