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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Carsmith <info@carsmith.biz>
Sent: Monday, 30 December 2024 2:41 PM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: GBK7065K ( D.O.A 16.12.2024 ) AFTER REPAIRED PHOTOS

Hi Steve Chen, 

Ok Accept. 

Alex Beh 

On 27-Dec-24 4:38 PM, Steve Chen (LKK Auto) wrote: 

Hi Jenny, 
  
Kindly refer our finalize $5500.00 (L/S, before GST). 7 days. (Subject to insurance approval) 
  
Please confirm. 
  
  
  
  
  
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
From: Jenny Ng <info@carsmith.biz>  
Sent: Friday, 27 December 2024 2:27 pm 
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: GBK7065K ( D.O.A 16.12.2024 ) AFTER REPAIRED PHOTOS 
  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Steve 

Enclosed after repaired photos for your kind perusal 

Please kindly let us have the finalized amount soonest 

Thank you and your assistance is greatly appreciated  
--  
BEST REGARDS 
  
JENNY NG 
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CARSMITH PRIVATE LIMITED 
Premier @ 8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4  
#04-35  
Singapore 415875 

--  
Regards, 
 
Alex Beh 
 
CARSMITH PTE LTD 
Premier@ 8 
Kaki Bukit Ave4  
# 04-35 
Singapore415875 
 
 
Mobile：9091 0000 
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