Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2025 2:56 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: Vehicle No. GBA 2625 E - Finalization

From: Banchoon <banchoon@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2025 2:55:43 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Vehicle No. GBA 2625 E - Finalization

Dear Taufikh

COR by lump @ $3400 (before GST) and 5 days for repairs —
Confirmed.

Thanks & Regards.

Perlin

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) [mailto:Taufikh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, January 16, 2025 2:40 PM

To: Banchoon <banchoon@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Vehicle No. GBA 2625 E - Finalization

Hi Perlin,

Please refer attached, COR l/s $3400, 5 days.
Subject to insurance approval

Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Banchoon <banchoon@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 23 December 2024 2:11 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Vehicle No. GBA 2625 E - Finalization

Hi Taufikh

Attached herewith are vehicle no. GBA 2625 E revised quotation and after
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Spray paint photos for your finalization.
Thanks & Regards.

Perlin

Virus-free.www.avg.com




